
(1) 

 
 
 

 
  

  

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 
NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 54 SHASANA 2025, BENGALURU, DATED:12.09.2025 
ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) 

(ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2025 ಇದಃౙ  2025 ರ ๲දౣ ಂಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 11ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ 
ಒඪ౭ ಡ අฉൟൿ౪ , ๬෥ನ౲  ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  2025 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 63 
ಎಂ්ർಜ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದย౵  (ූಗ-IVA) ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,-  

2025 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ :  63 
(2025 ರ  ๲දౣ ಂಬฑ  ൟಂಗಳ 12ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ ๸೉ಃಯย౵  ෮ದฤ ಪ౳ ಕಟ฿ಜං) 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 
ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 

 (2025 ರ ๲දౣ ಂಬฑ  ൟಂಗಳ  11ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ ಒඪ౭ ಡಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯมಜං) 
 

 ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 

ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ 2011ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ ಅඌඛಯಮ. 

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  

ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011ರ (2011ರ 
ಕකბಟಕದ ಅඌඛಯಮ 25)  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൞౨ ರඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  
เඋನ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

 1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬ , ಕකბಟಕ 
ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) 

ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪  . 

    

   ¨sÁUÀ  – 4J 
                                              Part – IVA 

 12 2025 ಪ  21 1947) 

BENGALURU, FRIDAY, 12  SEPTEMBER, 2025 BHADRAPADA 21, SHAKAVARSHA 1947) 
. 586

 No. 586 



2 

  2. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 3ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ 

เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ 
ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං)ರ 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ಘಡ (ಎ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎ) ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಇมಒ, 
ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರ, ಇವฆ ಅಧ౲ ౘฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 (ii) ಘಡ (෈)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(෈) ඛඃბಶಕฆ, ಅಂತಜბಲ ඛඃბಶකಲಯ, ಇವฆ ಸದಸ౲  

౽ಯბದ๏ბ෴ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 (iii) ಘಡ (ಎෆ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎෆ) ೉ೕෆ  ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಮൡ౨  ජಮბಲ౲  ಇมಒ.” 

 (iv) ಘಡ (ಎೖ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎෆ) ೉ೕෆ  ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ದ౾౹ ಣ ವಲಯ, ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ 
ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಇมಒ.” 

 3. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 11ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ๏ೕ๞ბಃಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “11. ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಮൡ౨  ಅඌ๰೉ತವಲ౵ ದ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  
൤ಡಯฤ ಮൡ౨  ಬಳಸฤ ಅඝಮൟ ඛೕലಃ.-“ 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (1)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(1) ಀല෷ವ ඛೕคನ ๬ವბಜඛಕ ෩ಲಗಳ ๸ರౘൕಡ ๸ීඌ๭ඈ൤ 

ತ൞ౙ ಲದย౵  ೦คಯย౵ ฆವ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛನ ಉಪීಧಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , (1ಎ) 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದല เක෵ൟ ಪഷದವರඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല๭, ෴ช ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඝ, 

ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರൽಂದ ಅඝಮൟ ಪഷಯದ ຄರൡ ಅಥ฿ ಅಥ฿ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  
๭౷ ೕಕค๭ದ ຄರൡ ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಅಥ฿ ಅඌ๰೉ತವಲ౵ ದ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ෴โඃ 

ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵  ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕಡತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .  

 (1ಎ) ಅඝಮൟ ಅಥ฿ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳  ಪഷ෷ವದคಂದ เකಯൟ 
ಪഷಯมದ ಛ౳ ಹಕರ ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ.- ຄಸ ಆಳๅ ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯฤ ಅඝಮൟ 

ಪഷ෷โൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ ൤ಡಯฤ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳  ಆೕฆโದคಂದ 
เක෵ൟಸತಕౙ  ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦൟๅ, ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (i) ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ ಬಳಃಗัಡ ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಮൡ౨  ನಗರ 
ಪ౳ ඃಶಗึರಡರล౵  ವಯ౾౨ ಕ ಠಹಪ෽ೕಜ ಛ౳ ಹಕฆ; 

 (ii) ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೩ ๭ౙ ೕ෨ಗำ; 



 3 

 (iii) ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಮൡ౨  ನಗರ ಪ౳ ඃಶಗึರಡರย౵ ನ ಸಶಸ౨ ი ಪഷಯ ౽ಯბ๸๲౩ ಗำ 

ಮൡ౨  ಄ಂൽ౳ ೕಯ ಸಶಸ౨ ი ඲ยೕ๺  ದಳಗಳ ౽ಯბ๸๲౩ ಗำ; 

 (iv) ಂ๞ ಚഖವഔಃಗำ; 

 (v) ಅಂತಜბಲ ൤ಡ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಎม౵  ಅಛคಃಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಗ൐ಛคಃ ඩ౳ ೬ಋౣ  ಗำ 

ಅಥ฿ ෩ಲ๷ಕಯბ ඩ౳ ೬ಋౣ ಗಳ ಎม౵  ඛಧბค๭ದ ಘಟಕಗัಡ ಄ವಲ ಀല෷ವ 
ಅಥ฿ ಠಹ ಬಳಃಯ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ෥ತ౳  ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  5ಘನ ෦ೕಟฑ  ವฉಡ; ಮൡ౨  

(vi) ಆฉ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಮൡ౨  ൧ೕഴൟ౨ ฆವ ವಸൟ ಅඩഡ ბ෫ಂഡ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ 

ಸ෩ಹ ๵๴ഔಗำ,- 

(ಎ) ಀല෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ ಬಳಃಗัಛಜ, ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳย౵  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸมದ 

ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  20 ಘನ ෦ೕಟฑ ಗಳವฉಡ ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ൤ಡ෷โൿ; 
ಮൡ౨  

(෈) ಸ౽ბค ๭ౙ ೕ෨ಗಳല ಆ൮ბಕ฿ಜ ൿಬბಲ ವಗბದವคಛಜฆವ ವಸൟ ಘಟಕಗำ. 

 (1෈) ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ຄರ൤ಡ෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಅದඝ౬  අಡ౥  ಪ౳ ෥ಣದย౵  ඛೕฆ 
ಸರಬฃ೩ർರฃಜ ಸರಬฃ೩ ෥ഴವ ಎม౵  ಌಸಜ ഓ౲ ಂಕฑ ಗำ, ಸ౽ბರโ 
ಅඌ๰೉ಸಬ๾ർඈ൤ ๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರൽಂದ ಅಂತಜბಲ ຄರ൤ಡ෷ದ౽ౙ ಜ 

ඛರಃ౹ ೕಪ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 4. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 17ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 

ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ฆವ (೬) ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(೬-1) ಅಂತಜბಲ ຄರ൤ಡ෷โದඝ౬  เඛಯ෦ಸฤ ಮൡ౨  ඛ฀ൟ౳ ಸฤ ಄ಂದ౳  
ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ದ ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳඝ౬  ๰ಕ౨  ෥ඩბഴಗูಂൽಡ 

ຄರലಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಅಳವല๭ಆಳ౶ ತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅඌ๰೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (೬-2) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳඝ౬  ౽ಯბಗತತัಸฤ ෴โඃ ಪ౳ ඃಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
೧ม౵  ಸ෦ൟ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಸ෦ൟಯඝ౬  ರ೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (೬-3) ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಸಮಪბಕ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಬಳಃ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಇತರ 

เಷಯಗಳย౵  ಅವฆಗಳ න౾ ಅಥ฿ ຄರಜನವคಂದ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರಃౙ  ಸಲກ ඛೕಡฤ ಅಥ฿ 
ಸ෥สೕ೉ಸฤ ಒಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ກ೉౞ ನ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ, ತቿರඝ౬  ຄಂൽฆವ ಉಪ-
ಸ෦ൟಯඝ౬  ರ೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .”  

 5. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 18ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 18ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಬದยಡ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“(3) ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ฆವ ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳ ಆඋರದ ෬ว 
฿൐ಜ౲ , ಅಛคಃ, ಗ൐ಛคಃ ෽ೕಜචಗำ, ෩ಲ๷ಕಯბ ෽ೕಜචಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರโ 

ಅඌ๰೉๭ඈ൤ අಡ౥ ಪ౳ ෥ಣದ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೧ನ ಬಳಃಛಜ ຄರ൤ಡ෷ವ 
ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಪ౳ ෥ಣದ ෬ฉಡ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ๰ಕ౨  ದರಗಳඝ౬  เඌಸಬ๾ൿ.”  

 



4 

6. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 32ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 32ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-  

(i) ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣ (1)ರ (෈) ಘಡದ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (෈) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎෆ) ಘಡದ 
ಅലಯย౵  ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಅಗತ౲ ಪലಸมಜൿ౪ ,- 

  (i) ಅಂಥ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ 
ඛฃಕค๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ౽ඞඝ ಬದ౫  ౽ರಣเಲ౵ ඃ ಉධ౾౹ ๭ದฉ ; ಅಥ฿  

  (ii) ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಅൿ ๯ำ౶  ಎಂ්ർಜ ൟั඀ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ ಒದಜ๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ಒದಜಸฤ ౽ರಣකದฉ ; 

- ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ඈಡൽಂದ ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ ෨ಂൿವคದ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಮൡ౨  ತฆ฿ಯದ เಫಲ൤ ಅಥ฿ 

ಉಲ౵ ಂಘචಯ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಅಂಥ เಫಲ൤෷ ಅಥ฿ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ ෨ಂൿವฉದ 
ಪ౳ ൟൽನಃౙ  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ກೋ౞ ವค ඈಡವඝ౬  เඌಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (2)ರย౵ ฆವ “ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದมಜ  “ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (iii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (4)ರย౵ ฆವ “ಹൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದมಜ  “ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

ಮൡ౨  

 (iv) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (4)ರ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(5) ๭ಂඎ฿ದ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಪഷಯದ ຄರൡ ඛೕರඝ౬  

൤ಡ෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಸದค ඛฃಃ౹ ೕಪ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  

ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๯ವ ෴ช ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ದ 
෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳ ಆඋರದ ෬ว ๰ಕ౨  ෥ඩბഴಗูಂൽಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ಅඌ๰೉๭ඈಥ 
ඈಡචಗูಂൽಡ  ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ ಆ೦ౢ ඝ๬ರ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย౵ , 

 
 

೧. ๏౳ ೕಧฑ 
ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ 

๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  
๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 5 

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 
NOTIFICATION 

NO.DPAL 54 SHASHANA 2025, BENGALURU, DATED:12.09.2025 
 

ූರತ ๸เඋನದ ಅඝ೎౟ ೕಧ 348ರ ಘಡ (3)ರ ಅലಯย౵  ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ 

ಅඌಂತತั๭ದ ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ 

๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 (2025ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 

63)ರ ූ๝ಂತರವඝ౬  ಅඌಂತ ಆಂಗ౵  ಪಠ౲ ๅಂൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ 

๸೉ಃಯย౵    (ූಗ-IVA) ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,- 

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 63 OF 2025 
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12th day of September, 2025) 

 
THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF 

DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025 
 (Received the assent of the Governor on the 11th day of September, 2025) 

 

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation and 
Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011.  

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ground water 
(Regulation and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka 
Act 25 of 2011), for the purposes hereinafter appearing.  

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of 
the Republic of India as follows:  

1. Short title and commencement. (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation and Control of Development and 
Management) (Amendment) Act, 2025.  

(2) It shall come into force at once.  

2. Amendment of section 3. In the Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation 
and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 25 of 
2011) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub section (3),-  

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-  

"(a) The Secretary to Government incharge of the Minor Irrigation and 
Ground water development, Government of Karnataka who shall be the chair 
person."  

(ii) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:-  

“(b) The Director, Groundwater Directorate, who shall be the Member 
Secretary."  

(iii) for clause (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(f) The Chief Engineer, Rural Drinking Water and Sanitation Department.” 



6 

(iv) for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(h) The Chief Engineer of south zone, Minor Irrigation and Groundwater 
Development Department.” 

3. Amendment of section 11.- In the principal Act, in section 11,- 

(i) for the heading, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“11. Grant of permit to extract and use of Ground Water in Notified and 
Non-Notified Areas.",  

(ii) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(1) Subject to the provisions of any other law for time being in force relating 
to the protection of public sources of drinking water, no ground water user, except 
those exempted under sub-section (1-A), shall drill or dig a well or extract, for any 
purpose in a notified and Non notified area without obtaining permit or No 
Objection Certificate from the Authority. 

(1-A). Categories of consumers who are exempted from obtaining permission 
or No Objection Certificate. The following categories of consumers shall be 
exempted from Obtaining Permit for drilling new Borewell and seeking No Objection 
Certificate for ground water extraction namely:-  

(i) Individual domestic consumers in both rural and urban areas for 
drinking water and domestic uses;  

(ii) Rural drinking water supply schemes;  
(iii) Armed Forces Establishments and Central Armed Police Forces 

establishments in both rural and urban areas;  
(iv) Agricultural activities; 
(v) All industries or mining projects or infrastructure projects drawing 

ground water only for drinking or domestic purposes up to 5 Cum 
per day in all assessment units, and  

(vi) Residential apartments and group housing societies who drill or 
dig,- 
 

(a) For drinking water and domestic uses, drawing ground water 
up to 20 m3 per day subject to the conditions specified in the 
guidelines; and 

(b) Dwelling units for Economically Weaker Sections under the 
Government schemes.  

(1-B) All private tankers abstracting ground water and use it for supply as 
bulk water suppliers shall have No Objection Certificate for ground water 
abstraction from the concerned authority as notified by the Government.” 

4. Amendment of section 17.- In the Principal Act, in section 17, in sub-
section (1), after clause (j), the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:-  

“(j-1) to issue, adopt and notify the guidelines issued by central groundwater 
authority for regulating and controlling the ground water extraction with suitable 
modifications; 



 7 

(j-2) to constitute the district committee or any committee for any area to 
implement the purpose of this Act; and 

 (j-3) to constitute a sub-committee consist of one or more members, experts 
from among themselves or outsiders to suggest or advice the authority in proper 
regulation or use of ground water or in any other matter.” 

5. Amendment of section 18.- In the Principal Act, in section 18, for sub-
section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(3) The authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of 
ground water extracted for the use of commercial, industrial, mining projects, 
infrastructure projects and bulk water supply as notified by the Government on 
the basis of guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority.” 

6. Amendment of section 32.- In the Principal Act, in section 32,- 

(i) in sub-section (1),for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, 
namely:-  

“(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under 
clause (f) of sub-section (1) of section 17 of this Act,- 

(i) Willfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such   
information or return; or 

(ii)  Willfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or 
return which he knows to be false: 

- Shall be liable for punishment with penalty which may extend to Fifty 
thousand rupees. In the case of continuing and subsequent failure or 
contravention, an additional Penalty which may extend to one thousand 
rupees for every day during which such failure or contravention continues, 
shall be imposed.” 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "five thousand," the words "twenty five 
thousand", shall be substituted; 

 
(iii) in sub-section (4), for the words "ten thousand", the words "twenty five 

thousand", shall be substituted; and 
 

(iv) after sub-section (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
 

“(5) Any person extracts the water without obtaining valid No Objection 
Certificate and violates the provisions of this Act and said No Objection Certificate, 
punishable with penalty as notified by the Government on the basis of guidelines 
issued by the Central Ground Water Authority, with suitable modifications.” 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



8 

The above translation of the ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ 

เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 (2025 ಕකბಟಕ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 63) be published in the official Gazette under clause (3) of Article 
348 of the Constitution of India. 
 

 

THAAWARCHAND GEHLOT 

GOVERNMENT OF KARNATAKA  
 
 

 

By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

 
 

G. SRIDHAR 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary Affairs 
and Legislation 

 
  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2025-09-12T20:00:15+0530
	THAMMAIAH




