S X n%

ORTITN TFLIXRT
cDZ’an oo B3

TN -9 o, BFTT, 0.9 BPowT', 9098 (PBHE S0, FIITF O PL) To. B0
Part —IVA BENGALURU, FRIDAY, 12 SEPTEMBER, 2025 (BHADRAPADA 21, SHAKAVARSHA 1947) No.586

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 54 SHASANA 2025, BENGALURU, DATED:12.09.2025

TOREEIT ©I03BED (923D, NI, JBEBHBOD IO TONR DONOIED)
(3TNEBB) ATXOANT, 2025 YT, 2025 T Ra,0200° 30NF 1138 DIV0TLOT Tossa00OT
2N BRTIW), AT 3FWPIMON AW, 2025 G FREET 9PN R0y 63
DOITON FVEET Do) (90N-IVA) BBEIRLIETOR) e3T3CDR NG, -

2025 O 30oF 833 e9D0HD Josls: 63
(2025 B RB,0200° 30N 123 DIJ0OFTTOR) T EIT Totss BIITI DR F0WFTONE), FBRTWD) FFEIeT0NG)

FOoFEdT 9030 (923,03, AVFBBVBOD dDOD DN TONP
NOD03)9) (3T BR) 9D ADHD, 2025

(2025 B A&@B,020T° 30N 1138 DIVOTTOL) Tousa0OD 0T 2uA),TON, &WBOHEINTI)

TOOEET O3WED (9D, NI, DWEBHBOAD IO TN
QAONO0I)E9) LIRDIONTD 201130, eI R, BT FTE e30TBEN 20T LI OND.

Q). Y30,3300T FORBIWTI ST LBNLON TooeEdT 9032 (€92)33,8,
BN3), ATEBBOD  IDODENT TONR  DONOIZED) 9RO, 20113 (20113
TOOEEITTT 9RDODD 25) 3T BT a00TIY)T 0T 200N TDOTS;

QR PTI  NPT%T DB,T0C  SREBRE), Fooc&dT Dot
LIDOTENOBORDOT 8 2RNI0ODTOIZ LIR30 :-

1. IOTR, BRIV DI), FYV0YW.- (1) &8 LRIADNE,, ToEEdT
03HEQ (9D, aNI, NWEBDBO ) DONTNT TNR DONOIJ)Ed) (ST L)
9RAONY, 2025 DO FTODNITE),.

(2) BT &8 TRPTWESK WoONR WTIT,), .

©



)

2. ByT0e0 30 3T BB.- TOoor&IT O3 ED (93D, DI, Dade BFBOD
L)AONTNT TN DONO0IED)  LRPAOND, 2011 (JE)., YILEN0TW DR
90NN OT E3CNRINT)T 33 WTT T (3)€ NVRTYTTLTE) -

(i) DOT ()T VTWN B3 EIODTTW,, 3 AWBRCBAITLED,, DOTWT:-

() ATIETT TIONEWIE, BD, DT 30I), LIOIWES 93D, YO,
TOOEEIT ATOE T, Ye3B) BPsFONTIT,TD,."

(i) HOT ()T WBN 83 0D TI,, )33 RAIT,T3), OTT:-

"(2d) AT ESTT, 903 TE® AT ETTOO, QY33 AR
FOONEWAEOIONTIT,E3),,."

(iii) DOT ()T WTWN B3 EI0DITW, 8 RBRCBATTLED,, DOTWT:-

"(F®) 235 YORIONTE, NMjeddEd TTONIE AICB) a0, ByaDED; Y0 8s.”

(iv) DOT (223°%)T TWN B3 TV0DITWI, &3 ABRCRAST,T),, DOTWT:-

"(FF) 2B BORIODT®, T 0 OO, AW, f003D 03, OIWED
€92033,8, B03.”

3. B30 118 3WI_RBR.- zDR 9RIONNT 113¢ FFTLTE),, -

(i) DEAFTNR TN T 2IODTTN,, TSR BAIBLE),, DOTT:-

"11. OPIRWZS H3I) DIAWITOE IICBTS), o3WFOTIN,
3o e D3I, WF¥IO) RTINS ACRF.-"

(i) @LWTTTD (1)T TWVN B3 TI0DITWN,, 3B RIT,T,, DOTT:-

(1) DRONE AOT  ATEBIT  aDRONE  ROTTHBNR  AOWORNATOI
339,03 DN B Y33 O0HTE TOSRIST NTLOFPNPT 2WwFRE,, (1)
NVRVETTEITIC AN S BEB T, BRTIVTEA), O30T €90326©) WFFTTLOT,
DYRDTOVROT BINNS VWONT BRTI) G000 LGP0 DU TT00 w33,
R LTDAT BRTI) DNAIABI 9T OPNINAWBITOE I3, 0303
B LITO,N 230eI0NT), FRTONIT,T.L). 9w 3CBIT,EL)..

(1) ONTH3 PP ATIRCFHO R RWVOMRITO0OT dTo0HS
RBODOOT MYBT0 FWNFNYN.- BPR FRP WeIONT, TRTON) 93003
B[BONPT DI, ©O03xE® 3RO AUISFTWo  RBF  FTRCCIHTOOT
LdVOON A 3T, WS NENF) B8 V0T 03e3, DOTWT:-

() DDROINT A3 DI, My® WFINPH  NMYedXD DI, <NJ
B3BRPTBBOR, BONET NyBIO3LCN NYB/TIY;

(i) M®eACEd TDHEONIEI AT ATWTOZ) A,Le0NP;



a

(i) MYeACD NI, SNT JWESNYTBTAS ATR, TBOD FTOODEROR, T
23I3), FCOYLOD ATR, FPOT BENE ToOEROR ND;

(iv) A 2FENTEITRSY;

(v) €903z 3RO TS DY TYMROTNY) 95300 NPT DB TN
9P FDRVOAPTONE DYBTING V9, APEDATW FETINPR TS DEONIS
G300 My WFPTOD NBLINPLMON 23503) 318 DSTT, 53 QCET® 331; 03,

(vi) TRTONNE T aNI), 3TV DA LIWEFENOEFNY) DI, Ny
RN RRALEINDD,-

() BBANT aNIY, Ny® WFINLMON, 300N RRWBNF). ADE R ABRRCIT
ROZNPNR 2WwFBED,, &8 DTT, 20 FS LT NFSTNR 9032633, 3RO)T;
D3I

() BTIED A,LaNFE BSRET 0N TNWED BNEWROMONTIEE 3A 3 R EITNALD.

(1) 03 EOT, BRTINOINE NI), VT, BRTW, TYeVEIT), LT
ATWTTIDTTN ATV 2008 D, DIAN E39;0TONY), AT Tag)
SIPARWAWBIDIETOI A0WORRE, DYPTOCROTW 903 BRTINRAINTWT,N
ATT T BI)ed3), BRODTIT,,."

4. R0 178 AW J/B.- DR BRIRDDT 173 JyF3S  (1)3¢
NBRTTTE) 303 (23) VOB 3303003 8% 2V0DITR, ACDRIT,T),, DOTT:-

"(2-1) €903 BRTIN AT, DO eNAD) 203, MODOZ RO FCOT)
O3WED DYPTOTey) BRTBAT ONEARWBNFI), ART, 00T BINEPON
BRTLRIT,R,, WPRRATRY,3T,R), aDI), WPAPWVAIT,T),,;

(23-2) B3 9RAODNTDT AT L3NF ), FTODENIRPPR) O30T T3 ST,N
23039, Aeddd eI OREHTHE AeddION, BB AIT,L,,; a3,

(23-3) OIBEOTW FINTJET DODO0IFD NI, WPT 9P O /3T
LROINPE) e9TTINY By ® €950 BRTNTROOT WY PTOTT, AT LTI €930
RSB RO)  200TD I BWLS ABA;D), IO, BRONTIEI  GVEI-
Re3OD, BBRIT,E,."

5. ®T0d 180 STHB/R.- DR PINTDT 183¢ TyTTLT WTWANR &3
20T TI, B3R RAITE,, DOTT:-

"(3) TCOTY) €903 WY TOTag) BRTRATIE 0N BRBNY ST a¢e3
0£3%5, ZNMOOT, NEMEDT O3B BN, tNROARTONE O3BCLINS) eI, AFoETeg)
ODRPBATO3 TBRW FeI0dlS OB ACWORS  WFIMNoN  BRTINROT
IOIEDT &WjadIodTS BB DY PTTeg) ART, BONP,, LdPRWIBIT.”



®

6. B T09 320 3WI_RBR.- 30RO LINIONNT 32:3¢ ByTTLTE),, -

(i) V- TTEd (1)3 (2J) DOTWT WTN B8 NI0RITN,, )33/ RIT,T30,,.

() B ORARNTDT 173 TJTTRE (1) VR -TTTEIE  (FF) DO
90N, C0EYTE 230308 €9TIa00 eIadT BWIjas )y WBNA) INI;BRRCIINT),, -

() ©OF V0od BT BTRBIW, WBNILD NRLS FPSE TN
QUTDATT BITeI0 TSR W, TOTEI K VY AT ; 95300

(i) O0eYTE 0208 T Je3T WIS, I AT, DOWITON 3PTWR
N FREE TN WwBNABT 9G0 2BNRE FOTEIIIT ;

- 80a33), AT BRTIONNFRTNR )R DRWTIWT BOBDOTW T3IOLIVINIT,T3),.
POOTICN)  ZNOTWRDT AOWLEERD), aDI), 3WoODTW  IPOI 9T
VOOTION FOWEEWD), 90T LIFOIAN) €90 LV OTION) eSS
B)3DTF, 0T CRTICNNYN IR DAWIITIIE T2),e30 OB, cdPRIT,T,.

(i) VBFTTeD (2)TDRE "8I AT TRTIONNP[TNR" D0 JWNY
TN "B&F_,3,4T30 A0edT e OINP TR 02 BBNP I, 31803¢RAIT,T),,;

(i) VBIT3D (4)3D TN "®I), AT TBRDIONNFRTNR” 00 JHRNY
BN "33, 4030 AeedT CREWoOINF TN 02 BWNF, &T)3O3eCRRIT,,,;
D3I,

(iv) VRT3 (4)3 3323003 B3 ZNV0RITWIY, ALDRIT,T,, DOTWT:-

“(5) RA0TNWOE DTORFTHO  BIedd),; BVBONT BRTI) B,

3RO BN, B LIIRAODNTNT YVBVWOGNF I, DI, AWD DTOT LTI &I,
PUDOPIRIE  OPBE  [5FO) FCOW) 03HEQ  DPTOTey) BRTRDAT
FONEAPWBNY S3HITT 3003 RRT, 2390w BINFLRODN ATOE Tag) L9RAPBATTIOT
BOBINLRODR BOLITINIT,T),."

FOOEEIT Do %5e00T €3230, 000
=3I, [T BROIS),,

2. deg3o*
RFOE VB FoONETIE
RORBOD 5355350N S 5H3y,
DOAS WS GO RB.



3

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO.DPAL 54 SHASHANA 2025, BENGALURU, DATED:12.09.2025

29003 R0IPOST e93023.LE 3488 DOTW (3)T BONC), Tossa00ODOT
ODTHINRPAT TOEET WOIHED (PTHD, NI, NDBEBHBOD )OS
ToNR DODNO03I)Ed) (BTN FBE) LD, 2025 (20258 T EIT €9DIODD FODs:
63)3 POTI03TRI, WPT3I SON, WBaS00) TooELT Toxs@BIT  OFCR
F0BFONS).  (9oN-IVA) &BFEIRICTOT e3T3AR DN, -

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 63 OF 2025
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12th day of September, 2025)

THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF
DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 11 day of September, 2025)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation and
Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ground water
(Regulation and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka
Act 25 of 2011), for the purposes hereinafter appearing.

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of
the Republic of India as follows:

1. Short title and commencement. (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation and Control of Development and
Management) (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3. In the Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation
and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 25 of
2011) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub section (3),-

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(@) The Secretary to Government incharge of the Minor Irrigation and
Ground water development, Government of Karnataka who shall be the chair
person.”

(ii) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(b) The Director, Groundwater Directorate, who shall be the Member
Secretary."

(iii) for clause (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(f) The Chief Engineer, Rural Drinking Water and Sanitation Department.”



&

(iv) for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(h) The Chief Engineer of south zone, Minor Irrigation and Groundwater
Development Department.”

3. Amendment of section 11.- In the principal Act, in section 11,-
(i) for the heading, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“11. Grant of permit to extract and use of Ground Water in Notified and
Non-Notified Areas.",

(ii) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Subject to the provisions of any other law for time being in force relating
to the protection of public sources of drinking water, no ground water user, except
those exempted under sub-section (1-A), shall drill or dig a well or extract, for any
purpose in a notified and Non notified area without obtaining permit or No
Objection Certificate from the Authority.

(1-A). Categories of consumers who are exempted from obtaining permission
or No Objection Certificate. The following categories of consumers shall be
exempted from Obtaining Permit for drilling new Borewell and seeking No Objection
Certificate for ground water extraction namely:-

(i) Individual domestic consumers in both rural and urban areas for
drinking water and domestic uses;

(ii) Rural drinking water supply schemes;

(iii) Armed Forces Establishments and Central Armed Police Forces
establishments in both rural and urban areas;

(iv) Agricultural activities;

(v) All industries or mining projects or infrastructure projects drawing
ground water only for drinking or domestic purposes up to 5 Cum
per day in all assessment units, and

(vi) Residential apartments and group housing societies who drill or
dig,-

(a) For drinking water and domestic uses, drawing ground water
up to 20 m3 per day subject to the conditions specified in the
guidelines; and

(b) Dwelling units for Economically Weaker Sections under the
Government schemes.

(1-B) All private tankers abstracting ground water and use it for supply as
bulk water suppliers shall have No Objection Certificate for ground water
abstraction from the concerned authority as notified by the Government.”

4. Amendment of section 17.- In the Principal Act, in section 17, in sub-
section (1), after clause (j), the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:-

“(-1) to issue, adopt and notify the guidelines issued by central groundwater
authority for regulating and controlling the ground water extraction with suitable
modifications;



&

(j-2) to constitute the district committee or any committee for any area to
implement the purpose of this Act; and

(j-3) to constitute a sub-committee consist of one or more members, experts
from among themselves or outsiders to suggest or advice the authority in proper
regulation or use of ground water or in any other matter.”

5. Amendment of section 18.- In the Principal Act, in section 18, for sub-
section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) The authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of
ground water extracted for the use of commercial, industrial, mining projects,
infrastructure projects and bulk water supply as notified by the Government on
the basis of guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority.”

6. Amendment of section 32.- In the Principal Act, in section 32,-

(i) in sub-section (1),for clause (b), the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under
clause (f) of sub-section (1) of section 17 of this Act,-

(i) Willfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such
information or return; or

(ii) Willfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or
return which he knows to be false:

- Shall be liable for punishment with penalty which may extend to Fifty
thousand rupees. In the case of continuing and subsequent failure or
contravention, an additional Penalty which may extend to one thousand
rupees for every day during which such failure or contravention continues,
shall be imposed.”

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "five thousand," the words "twenty five
thousand", shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (4), for the words "ten thousand", the words "twenty five
thousand", shall be substituted; and

(iv) after sub-section (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(5) Any person extracts the water without obtaining valid No Objection
Certificate and violates the provisions of this Act and said No Objection Certificate,
punishable with penalty as notified by the Government on the basis of guidelines
issued by the Central Ground Water Authority, with suitable modifications.”



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297 ¢

The above translation of the TQOREEIT LHOZHED (92D, DI, De3E BBOR
0NN TN AON0IZE) (ST RIBB) IPAODD, 2025 (2025 TFIEELT

9RO A08s: 63) be published in the official Gazette under clause (3) of Article
348 of the Constitution of India.

THAAWARCHAND GEHLOT
GOVERNMENT OF KARNATAKA

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,

G. SRIDHAR
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs
and Legislation

BB Torle BBBB- FoBUTAREDOM, BoFLId DoBE3, SErd Beol, FTToVA, oried

THAMMAIAH




		2025-09-12T20:00:15+0530
	THAMMAIAH




