
(1) 

 
 
 
 
 

 
  

  

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À À̧¨sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÁgÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À¸À s̈É 

K¼À£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 
ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2025 
(2025gÀ «zsÁ£À À̧ s̈ÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ À̧ASÉå-43) 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 

ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ 2011ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ เඒಯಕ. 

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  

ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011ರ (2011ರ 
ಕකბಟಕದ ಅඌඛಯಮ 25)  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൞౨ ರඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  

เඋನ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

 1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬ , ಕකბಟಕ 
ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) 

ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪  . 

  2. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 3ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ 
เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ 

ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං)ರ 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ಘಡ (ಎ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

    

   ¨sÁUÀ  – 4J 
                                              Part – IVA 

 13 2025  22 1947) 

BENGALURU, WEDNESDAY, 13  AUGUST, 2025 SHRAVANA  22, SHAKAVARSHA 1947) 
. 476

 No. 476 



2 

 “(ಎ) ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಇมಒ, 

ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರ, ಇವฆ ಅಧ౲ ౘฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 (ii) ಘಡ (෈)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(෈) ඛඃბಶಕฆ, ಅಂತಜბಲ ඛඃბಶකಲಯ, ಇವฆ ಸದಸ౲  

౽ಯბದ๏ბ෴ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 (iii) ಘಡ (ಎෆ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎෆ) ೉ೕෆ  ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಮൡ౨  ජಮბಲ౲  ಇมಒ.” 

 (iv) ಘಡ (ಎೖ)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎෆ) ೉ೕෆ  ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ದ౾౹ ಣ ವಲಯ, ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ 
ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಇมಒ.” 

 3. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 11ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ๏ೕ๞ბಃಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “11. ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಮൡ౨  ಅඌ๰೉ತವಲ౵ ದ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  

൤ಡಯฤ ಮൡ౨  ಬಳಸฤ ಅඝಮൟ ඛೕലಃ.-“ 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (1)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(1) ಀല෷ವ ඛೕคನ ๬ವბಜඛಕ ෩ಲಗಳ ๸ರౘൕಡ ๸ීඌ๭ඈ൤ 

ತ൞ౙ ಲದย౵  ೦คಯย౵ ฆವ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛನ ಉಪීಧಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , (1ಎ) 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದല เක෵ൟ ಪഷದವರඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല๭, ෴ช ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඝ, 
ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರൽಂದ ಅඝಮൟ ಪഷಯದ ຄರൡ ಅಥ฿ ಅಥ฿ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  

๭౷ ೕಕค๭ದ ຄರൡ ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಅಥ฿ ಅඌ๰೉ತವಲ౵ ದ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ෴โඃ 

ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵  ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕಡತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .  

 (1ಎ) ಅඝಮൟ ಅಥ฿ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳  ಪഷ෷ವದคಂದ เකಯൟ 
ಪഷಯมದ ಛ౳ ಹಕರ ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ.- ຄಸ ಆಳๅ ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯฤ ಅඝಮൟ 
ಪഷ෷โൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂತಜბಲ ൤ಡಯฤ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳  ಆೕฆโದคಂದ 

เක෵ൟಸತಕౙ  ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦൟๅ, ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (i) ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ ಬಳಃಗัಡ ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಮൡ౨  ನಗರ 

ಪ౳ ඃಶಗึರಡರล౵  ವಯ౾౨ ಕ ಠಹಪ෽ೕಜ ಛ౳ ಹಕฆ; 

 (ii) ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಀല෷ವ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೩ ๭ౙ ೕ෨ಗำ; 

 (iii) ಛ౳ ෦ೕಣ ಮൡ౨  ನಗರ ಪ౳ ඃಶಗึರಡರย౵ ನ ಸಶಸ౨ ი ಪഷಯ ౽ಯბ๸๲౩ ಗำ 

ಮൡ౨  ಄ಂൽ౳ ೕಯ ಸಶಸ౨ ი ඲ยೕ๺  ದಳಗಳ ౽ಯბ๸๲౩ ಗำ; 

 (iv) ಂ๞ ಚഖವഔಃಗำ; 



 3 

 (v) ಅಂತಜბಲ ൤ಡ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಎม౵  ಅಛคಃಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಗ൐ಛคಃ ඩ౳ ೬ಋౣ  ಗำ 

ಅಥ฿ ෩ಲ๷ಕಯბ ඩ౳ ೬ಋౣ ಗಳ ಎม౵  ඛಧბค๭ದ ಘಟಕಗัಡ ಄ವಲ ಀല෷ವ 
ಅಥ฿ ಠಹ ಬಳಃಯ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ෥ತ౳  ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  5ಘನ ෦ೕಟฑ  ವฉಡ; ಮൡ౨  

(vi) ಆฉ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಮൡ౨  ൧ೕഴൟ౨ ฆವ ವಸൟ ಅඩഡ ბ෫ಂഡ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ 

ಸ෩ಹ ๵๴ഔಗำ,- 

(ಎ) ಀല෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹ ಬಳಃಗัಛಜ, ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳย౵  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸมದ 

ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  20 ಘನ ෦ೕಟฑ ಗಳವฉಡ ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ൤ಡ෷โൿ; 
ಮൡ౨  

(෈) ಸ౽ბค ๭ౙ ೕ෨ಗಳല ಆ൮ბಕ฿ಜ ൿಬბಲ ವಗბದವคಛಜฆವ ವಸൟ ಘಟಕಗำ. 

“(1෈) ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ຄರ൤ಡ෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಅದඝ౬  අಡ౥  ಪ౳ ෥ಣದย౵  ඛೕฆ 
ಸರಬฃ೩ർರฃಜ ಸರಬฃ೩ ෥ഴವ ಎม౵  ಌಸಜ ഓ౲ ಂಕฑ ಗำ, ಸ౽ბರโ 
ಅඌ๰೉ಸಬ๾ർඈ൤ ๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರൽಂದ ಅಂತಜბಲ ຄರ൤ಡ෷ದ౽ౙ ಜ 

ඛರಃ౹ ೕಪ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 4. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 17ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ฆವ (೬) ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(೬-1) ಅಂತಜბಲ ຄರ൤ಡ෷โದඝ౬  เඛಯ෦ಸฤ ಮൡ౨  ඛ฀ൟ౳ ಸฤ ಄ಂದ౳  

ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ದ ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳඝ౬  ๰ಕ౨  ෥ඩბഴಗูಂൽಡ 
ຄರലಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಅಳವല๭ಆಳ౶ ತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅඌ๰೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (೬-2) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳඝ౬  ౽ಯბಗತತัಸฤ ෴โඃ ಪ౳ ඃಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
೧ม౵  ಸ෦ൟ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಸ෦ൟಯඝ౬  ರ೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (೬-3) ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಸಮಪბಕ ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಬಳಃ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಇತರ 

เಷಯಗಳย౵  ಅವฆಗಳ න౾ ಅಥ฿ ຄರಜನವคಂದ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರಃౙ  ಸಲກ ඛೕಡฤ ಅಥ฿ 
ಸ෥สೕ೉ಸฤ ಒಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ກ೉౞ ನ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ, ತቿರඝ౬  ຄಂൽฆವ ಉಪ-
ಸ෦ൟಯඝ౬  ರ೉ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .”  

 5. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 18ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 18ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಬದยಡ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“(3) ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ฆವ ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳ ಆඋರದ ෬ว 

฿൐ಜ౲ , ಅಛคಃ, ಗ൐ಛคಃ ෽ೕಜචಗำ, ෩ಲ๷ಕಯბ ෽ೕಜචಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರโ 

ಅඌ๰೉๭ඈ൤ අಡ౥ ಪ౳ ෥ಣದ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೧ನ ಬಳಃಛಜ ຄರ൤ಡ෷ವ 
ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಪ౳ ෥ಣದ ෬ฉಡ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ๰ಕ౨  ದರಗಳඝ౬  เඌಸಬ๾ൿ.”  

6. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 32ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 32ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-  

(i) ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣ (1)ರ (෈) ಘಡದ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (෈) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎෆ) ಘಡದ 
ಅലಯย౵  ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಅಗತ౲ ಪലಸมಜൿ౪ ,- 



4 

  (i) ಅಂಥ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ 

ඛฃಕค๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ౽ඞඝ ಬದ౫  ౽ರಣเಲ౵ ඃ ಉධ౾౹ ๭ದฉ ; ಅಥ฿  

  (ii) ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಅൿ ๯ำ౶  ಎಂ්ർಜ ൟั඀ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ ಒದಜ๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ಒದಜಸฤ ౽ರಣකದฉ ; 

- ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ඈಡൽಂದ ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ ෨ಂൿವคದ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಮൡ౨  ತฆ฿ಯದ เಫಲ൤ ಅಥ฿ 

ಉಲ౵ ಂಘචಯ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಅಂಥ เಫಲ൤෷ ಅಥ฿ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ ෨ಂൿವฉದ 
ಪ౳ ൟൽನಃౙ  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ກೋ౞ ವค ඈಡವඝ౬  เඌಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (2)ರย౵ ฆವ “ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದมಜ  “ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (iii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (4)ರย౵ ฆವ “ಹൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದมಜ  “ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

ಮൡ౨  

 (iv) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (4)ರ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(5) ๭ಂඎ฿ದ ඛฃධౘ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಪഷಯದ ຄರൡ ඛೕರඝ౬  

൤ಡ෷ವ ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಸದค ඛฃಃ౹ ೕಪ൏ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  

ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๯ವ ෴ช ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ຄರല๭ದ 
෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳ ಆඋರದ ෬ว ๰ಕ౨  ෥ඩბഴಗูಂൽಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ಅඌ๰೉๭ඈಥ 

ඈಡචಗูಂൽಡ  ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

  

ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 
 

 ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 

ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (2011ರ ಕකბಟಕದ ಅඌඛಯಮ 25)ඝ౬  ಈ 

෨ಂൽನโಗัಛಜ ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ಅವಶ౲ ಕๅಂൿ ಪคಗ൐ಸมಜං,- 

(i) 2025-26ರ ಆಯವ౲ ಯ ූಷಣವඝ౬  ೦คತั๯โൿ; 

(ii) ಆಡัತ ๯උರ൏ ಆ෽ೕಗ-2ರ ๏මರ๯౺ ಗಳඝ౬  ೦คಡತฆโൿ; 

(iii) ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರ, ຄಸංಹย, ಇವฆ ຄರല๭ದ 

෥ಗბ๰೉ಗಳඝ౬  ಅಳವല๭ಆำ౶ โൿ; ಮൡ౨  

(iv) ಜನเ ౷๎ ๺ (ಉಪීಧಗಳ ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2023 (2023ರ 

಄ಂದ౳ ಅඌඛಯಮ18)ರ ಅඝ๬ರ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಅಳವല๭ಆำ౶ โൿ. 

 

ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඒಯಕ. 



 5 

ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  
 

ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ౱ ಕ ಕ౳ ಮโ ෴โඃ ກ೉౞ ನ ๅಚ౞ ವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆโൽಲ౵ . 
 

 
ಎ๺ . ಎ๺ . ැೕಸฃ೩ 

ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค, เ೦ౢ ನ ಮൡ౨  
൪ತ౳ ೦ౢ ನ ෱ൟ౳  

 
 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

ಅඝීಧ  
ಕකბಟಕ ಅಂತಜბಲ (ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಯ เඛಯಮನ ๻ಟ 

ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (2011ರ ಕකბಟಕದ ಅඌඛಯಮ 25)ರ ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ   
XXX                           XXX                           XXX  

3. ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರದ ರಚච.- XXX     XXX    XXX 
 (3) ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ಸದಸ౲ ฆಗಳඝ౬  ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ, ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, ಜಲ๸ಪඞ౱ ಲ ಇมಒ, ಸಣ౧  ඛೕฃವค, 
ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರ, ಇವฆ ಅಧ౲ ౘฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
 (෈) ಖඛಜ ಮൡ౨  ේเ೦ౢ ನ ಆ෷ಕ౨ ฆ ಅಥ฿ ඛඃბಶಕฆ, ಇವฆ ಸದಸ౲  
౽ಯბದ๏ბ෴ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
 (๭) ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರದ ಆ൮ბಕ ಇมಒಯ ಒಬ౯ ฆ ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ; 
 (ല) ඩ౳ ඃ๏ಕ ඛඃბಶಕฆ, ಄ಂದ౳  ಅಂತಜბಲ ෱ಡั, ූರತ ಸ౽ბರ; 
 (ಇ) ಪ౳ ඃಶದ ෬ว ಅඌ౽ರ ฿౲ ඪ౨ ෷ಳ౶  เൿ౲ ൬ ಸರಬฃ೩ ಉಪඛಯ 
೉ೕෆ ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ ದ೬ბಜಂತ ಕല෫ಯಲ౵ ದ ಒಬ౯  ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ; 
 (ಎෆ) ೉ೕෆ ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ಆฑ ലಇല, ಛ౳ ෦ೕ൏෗ไൽ౫  ಮൡ౨  
ඵೈಯ൬ ฃ೴ ಇมಒ; 
 (೧) ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ ಇඨ ೉ೕෆ, ಜಲ๸ಪඞ౱ ಲ ಇมಒಯ ಜಲ๸ಪඞ౱ ಲಗಳ 
ಅ෗ไൽ౫  ๸๲౩ ; 
(ಎೖ) ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ කಮඛඃბ๏๯ವ ೉ೕෆ ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ಸಣ౧  
ඛೕฃವค ; 
(ಐ) ಅಧ౲ ౘฆ, ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  ෥ยನ౲  ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ ෱ಡย; 
 (೬) ಂ๞ ಆ෷ಕ౨ ฆ / ඛඃბಶಕฆ, ಂ๞ ಇมಒ; 
 (ಃ) ෨ಖ౲  ಮ๻ ಪ౳ ීಧಕ, ฃ๞ౣ იೕಯ ಂ๞ ಮൡ౨  ಛ౳ ෦ೕ൏෗ไൽ౫  
෇౲ ಂಋ, ෍ಂಗิฆ; 
 (ಎฯ) ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ කಮඛඃბ๏๯ವ කฤౙ  ಜನ ซತ ಪ౳ ൟඛඌಗำ; 
 (ಎಂ) ೉ೕෆ ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ಕකბಟಕ ನಗರ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೩ ಮൡ౨  ಅ෗ไൽ౫  
෱ಡั; 
 (ಎඨ) ೉ೕෆ ಇಂ೧ඛಯฑ, ෍ಂಗิฆ ඛೕฆ ಸರಬฃ೩ ಮൡ౨  ಒಳಚฏല 
෱ಡั;  



6 

 (ಒ) ಸ౽ბರโ කಮඛඃბ๏๯ವ ಅಂತಜბಲ ๸ීಧದ เಷಯಗಳย౵  
เ๕ಷ ൟำವัಃ ಅಥ฿ ඩ౳ ෽ೕಜಕ ಅඝಭವ ຄಂൽฆವ ಇಬ౯ ฆ 
ಸದಸ౲ ฆಗำ. 

XXX                           XXX                           XXX  
11. ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ൤ಡಯฤ ಮൡ౨  ಬಳಸฤ 

ಅඝಮൟಯ ඛೕലಃ.- (1) ಀല෷ವ ඛೕคನ ๬ವბಜඛಕ ෩ಲಗಳ ๸ರౘൕಡ 
๸ීඌ๭ದ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛನ ಉಪීಧಗัತಳಪഖౣ , ෴่ಬ౯  ಅಂತಜბಲ 
ಬಳಃർರඝ, ็ಯ౾౨ ಕ ಅಥ฿ ಸ෨ർಯದ ಬಳಃಯ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಅඌ๰೉ತ ಪ౳ ඃಶದย౵  ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯฤ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕಡฤ ಇ೉౟ ๭ದย౵ , ಆತඝ ಈ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಆೕค ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರಃౙ  ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಸย౵ ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  
ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರൽಂದ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷದ ຄರൡ ๻ಡ ಆฉ෷โದಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ 
൧ೕഴโದಃౙ  ๸ීඌ๭ದ ෴โඃ ಚഖವഔಃಡ ൧ಡಗತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ . 

 (2) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದലಯย౵ ನ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಂൿ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಅಛคಃ, ฿൐ಜ౲  
ಮඣೕฏಜච, ಂ๞ ಮൡ౨  ಠಹಂತ౲  ෨ಂ൞ದ ෎ರ ෎ฉ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ, ෎ฉ ෎ฉ 
ಪ౳ ඃಶಗัಛಜ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ๑ಲౙ ದ ೯൤ಡ, ಅಂಥ เವರಗಳඣ౬ ಳತಂഴ 
ಅಂಥ คೕൟಯย౵  ๻ಟ ಅಂಥ ನ෩චಯย౵  ಸย౵ ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

XXX                           XXX                           XXX  
17. ಅಂತಜბಲ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರದ ಅඌ౽ರಗำ.- (1) ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ಅಥ฿ ಈ ಬಡ౛  

ಅದคಂದ ย಍ತದ ಅඌ౽ರ ಪഷದ ෴่ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ಅඌ౽ರಗಳඝ౬  
ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ౪ :- 

 (ಎ) ෴โඃ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ඣಳಃౙ  ෴โඃ ಸ෱ಜಸ ಸಮಯದย౵  ಪ౳ ๆ๏๯โൿ ಮൡ౨  
๸ಬAඌ๭ದ ේ෦ಯ ಅಥ฿ ේ෦ಯ ෬ว౱ ೖಯย౵  ಅಥ฿ ේ෦ಯ 
ಅಂತฃಳದย౵  ಇฆವ ඛೕคನ ಪค๏ೕಲච ෥ഴโൿ ๻ಟ ಅದರ ෴โඃ ಅಳ൤ಯඝ౬  
൤ಡൿಆำ౶ โൿ; 

 (෈) ඛ෦ბಸมದ ಅಥ฿ ಆฉಯมದ ಅಥ฿ ಈಛಗศ ಆฉൽฆವ ෇เಯඝ౬  
ಮൡ౨  ಅದคಂದ ಅಡൿ ൤ಡದ ಮ൒౧  ๻ಟ ಇತರ ವ๯౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ಪคೕ౾౹ ๯โൿ; 

 (๭) ಅಂಥ ෇เ෵ಂದ ຄರ൤ಡದ ಅಂಥ ಮ൐౧ ನ ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ವ๯౨ ಗಳ ಅಥ฿ 
ඛೕคನ ෥ದคಗಳඝ౬  ಪഷ෷โൿ; 

 (ല) ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕഴൟ౨ ฆವ ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಅದคಂದ ൤ಡದ 
ಮ൐౧ ನ ಅಥ฿ ෴โๆ ವ๯౨ ಗಳ ෥ದคಯඝ౬ , ಃಲಸವඝ౬  තಣბತั๭ದ ಅಥ฿ 
෈ഖౣ ෈ಟౣ  ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ෩ฆ ൟಂಗัಡ ෦ೕರඈಥ ಅವඌಯವฉಡ, ඛಯ෦ಸมದ 
คೕൟಯย౵  ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸಬ๾ർඈ൤ ಇಡ෎ಃಂൿ ಮൡ౨  
๸ರ౾౹ ಸ෎ಃಂൿ ย಍ತ ಆඃಶ ඛೕഴโൿ ಮൡ౨  ಆ ತฆ฿ಯ ಅಂಥ ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ๻ಡ 
ಅಗತ౲  ಪല๭ದ౪ ඝ౬  ඩยಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (ಇ) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳඝ౬  ౽ಯბಗತತัಸฤ ๸ීඌ๭ದ ർಖว 
ಅಥ฿ ದ๬౨ ๆ೩ಗಳ ಪ౳ ൟಗಳඝ౬  ಪคೕ౾౹ ๯โൿ ಮൡ౨  ಪഷ෷โൿ ๻ಟ 
(ಆฉ෷ൟ౨ ฆವ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕഴൟ౨ ฆವ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕലದ ෇เಯ ฿౲ ಸ ಅಥ฿ ಆಳ, 
ಎ๠ౣ  ಆಳ ಅಡർಗ ඛೕฆ ๭౾ౙ ൡ ๻ಟ ತದඦತರ ෴ವ ಆಳಃౙ  ඛೕฆ ൡಂ෈ ඛಂൟൡ, 
෇เಯඝ౬  ൧ೕഴൟ౨ ฆ฿ಗ ๭ಕౙ  เเಧ ේ ಪದฆಗಳ ෥ದค ಮൡ౨  ඛೕคನ ಞಣಮಟౣ  
ಇโಗำ ಒಳತಂഽ൤) ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯฤ ಅವಶ౲ ಕ฿ದ ෴โඃ 
ಪ౳ ๔౬ ಯඝ౬  ಄ำโൿ ; 

 (ಎෆ) ಅಂತಜბಲದ ෴่ಬ౯  ಬಳಃർರඝ ಅಥ฿ ෇เ ಆฉ෷ವ ಅಥ฿ 
൧ೕഴವ ಏ೬ඛ౺ ෷ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ෥๼ൟಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ವರൽಗಳඝ౬  ಅಂಥ 
ನ෩චಯย౵  ಅಂಥ ౽มಂತರಗಳย౵  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ เವರಗูಂൽಡ ಒದಜಸ෎ಃಂൿ 



 7 

ಅಗತ౲ ಪല๯ವ ಒಂൿ ඣೕഔೕಸඝ౬  ೦ค ෥ഴโൿ ಅಥ฿ ೦ค ෥ഴ๋൤ 
෥ഴโൿ ಮൡ౨  ๻ಡ ೦ค ෥ലർಗ ಆ ಬಳಃർರඝ ಅಥ฿ ෇เ ಆฉ෷ವ 
ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕഴವ ಏ೬ඛ౺ ෷ ಅಗತ౲  ಪല๭ඈಥ ಅಂಶಗಳඝ౬  ඩยಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (೧) ඛೕคನ ಬಳಃಯ ಆಡัತವඝ౬  ಸค෴ಜ ෥ಡฤ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂತಜბಲ 
ಬಳಃർರඝ ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ಅലಯย౵  ರ೉๭ದ 
ඛಯಮಗಳඝ౬  ඩย๯ൟ౨ ಲ౵  ಎಂൿ ඦಬฤ ౽ರಣಗัದ౪ ฉ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಇತರ ๰ಕ౨  
౽ರಣಗัಛಜ ಅವಶ౲ ಕเದ౪ ฉ ಜಲ ෥ಪನ ๬ಧನವඝ౬  ಅಳವല๯๋൤ ಅಂತಜბಲ 
ಬಳಃർರನඝ౬  ಅಗತ౲ ಪല๯โൿ: 

 ಪฏൡ, ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඝ ತನಡ ඛೕലದ ඛඃბಶನಗಳඝ౬  ෩ವൡ౨  ൽನಗಳ 
ಅವඌ෽ಳಡ ඩยಸൽದ౪ ย౵ , ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ൞කಜ෻ ಅಂಥ ಜಲ ෥ಪನ ๬ಧನವඝ౬  
ಅಳವലಸಬ๾ൿ ಮൡ౨  ๻ಡ ඩยಸฤ ತඪ౭ ದ ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඛಂದ ๅಚ౞ ವඝ౬  
ವ๰ฤ ෥ಡಬ๾ൿ. 

 (ಎೖ) ౽ඞඝ෇๼ರ฿ಜ ෇เಯඝ౬  ಆฉಯฤ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕಡฤ ಮൡ౨  
ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ൤ಡಯฤ ಉಪ෽ೕಜ๭ದ ෴โඃ ฀൧౳ ೕಪಕರಣಗಳඝ౬  
ಜඹ౨ ෥ഴโൿ ಮൡ౨  ඛವბ๼ಸมದ ౽ಮಛคಯඝ౬  ූಗ๛ ಅಥ฿ තಣბ฿ಜ 
කಶಪല๯โൿ. 

 (ಐ) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ ಅലಯย౵  ರ೉๭ದ 
ඛಯಮಗಳඝ౬  ඩยಸದ ෴่ಬ౯  ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರನඝ౬  ෴โඃ 
ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  ෬ว ൤ಡ෷โದඝ౬  ඛย౵ ಸ෎ಃಂൿ, ಅದಃౙ  เൿ౲ ൬ ಸರಬฃಜඝ౬  
౾ൡ౨ ๻ಕ෎ಃಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ಅലಯย౵  ರ೉๭ದ ඛಯಮಗಳ 
෬ฉಡ ౽ඞඝ ෇๼ರๅಂൿ ಉഴීದ ෴โඃ ຃റ౳ ยಋ ౽ಮಛคಯඝ౬  
ವಶಪല๭ಆಳ౶ ෎ಃಂൿ ಅಗತ౲ ಪല๯โൿ: 

 ಪฏൡ, ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඝ ತನಡ ඛೕലದ ඛඃბಶನಗಳඝ౬  ಅಂಥ ಕറ౥ ಯ 
ಆೕคಃಯඝ౬  ຄರല๭ದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಅರವൡ౨  ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌ෽ಳಡ ඩยಸൽದ౪ ย౵ , 
ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ ൞කಜ෻ ಅವಶ౲ ಕ ౽ಮಛคಯඝ౬  ಅತಳ౶ ಬ๾ൿ ಮൡ౨  
౽ඞඝ෇๼ರ ಅಂತಜბಲ ಬಳಃർರඛಂದ ಅದರ ๅಚ౞ ವඝ౬  ವ๰ฤ ෥ಡಬ๾ൿ. 

 (೬) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅലಯย౵ ನ ಅಪฃಧವඝ౬  ෥ಡมಜං ಅಥ฿ 
෥ಡมಞൟ౨ ං ಎಂൿ ൞ඝ ඦಬฤ ౽ರಣಗัฆವ ෴โඃ ಸ౩ ಳವඝ౬  ൞ඝ 
ಅವಶ౲ ಕๅಂൿ ූเಸಬ๾ർඈಥ චರเඣಂൽಡ ಎม౵  ๰ಕ౨  ಸಮಯದย౵  
ಪ౳ ๆ๏๯โൿ ಮൡ౨  ๗ೕඌ๯โൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅಪฃಧವඝ౬  ෥ലದ ಅಥ฿ ෥ഴൟ౨ ฆವ 
ವ౲ ౾౨ ಡ ෩ವൡ౨  ൽನಗัಡ ෦ೕರದ ಒಂൿ ඛൽბಷౣ  ಅವඌಯย౵  ಅಂತಜბಲವඝ౬  
൤ಡಯඈ൤ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳಸඈ൤ ย಍ತದย౵  ಆඃ๏๯โൿ; 

 (ಃ) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ಅലಯย౵  ರ೉๭ದ ඛಯಮಗಳ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳඝ౬  
ಈസค๯โದ౽ౙ ಜ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ಅಥ฿ ಅವಶ౲ ಕ฿ಗಬ๾ർඈಥ ಇತರ 
ಅඌ౽ರಗಳඝ౬  ಚม෵๯โൿ. 

XXX                           XXX                           XXX 
18. ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರದ ඛඌಗำ.- XXX                           XXX                           XXX  

(3) ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರโ, ಸ౽ბರದ ಅඝ෮ೕದච෽ಂൽಡ ಅಛคಃ, ฿൐ಜ౲  ಮൡ౨  
ಮඣೕฏಜච ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ൤ಡಯมದ ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಪ౳ ෥ಣದ ෬ว 
ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥ คೕൟಯย౵  ๰ಕ౨  ದರಗಳඝ౬  เඌಸಬ๾ൿ. 

XXX                           XXX                           XXX  
32. ಅಪฃಧಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඈಡಗำ.- (1) ෴่ಬ౯  ಅಂತಜბಲದ ಬಳಃർರඝ 

ಅಥ฿ ෇เ ಆฉ෷ವ/൧ೕഴವ ಏ೬ඛ౺ ෷,- 



8 

 (ಎ) ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ ಅದคಂದ ಅඌ౽ರ ಪഷದ ෴่ಬ౯  ಇತರ ವ౲ ౾౨ ಡ ಈ 
ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅലಯย౵ ನ ෴โඃ ಅඌ౽ರಗಳඝ౬  ಚม෵ಸฤ ಅല౥ ಪല๭ದฉ, 
ಅಥ฿ 

 (෈) 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎෆ) ಘಡದ ಅലಯย౵  ෴โඃ 
෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಅಗತ౲ ಪലಸมಜൿ౪ ,- 

 (i) ಅಂಥ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ 
ඛฃಕค๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ౽ඞඝ ಬದ౫  ౽ರಣเಲ౵ ඃ ಉධ౾౹ ๭ದฉ ; ಅಥ฿  

 (ii) ෴โඃ ෥๼ൟ ಅಥ฿ เವರ ಪತ౳ ವඝ౬  ಅൿ ๯ำ౶  ಎಂ්ർಜ ൟั඀ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ තವბಕ฿ಜ ಒದಜ๭ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ಒದಜಸฤ ౽ರಣකದฉ ; 
- ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ೩ม౱ චಡ ಮൡ౨  / ಅಥ฿ ಆฆ 
ൟಂಗำಗಳ ಅವඌಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ౽ฃ฿ಸ ๏ಃ౹ ಡ ಅಥ฿ ಅๅರಡ ౙಁ  
ಞค෴ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ ෨ಂൿವคದ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಮൡ౨  ತฆ฿ಯದ 
เಫಲ൤ ಅಥ฿ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘචಯ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ๻ಡ ಆ เಫಲ൤෷ ಅಥ฿ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷ 
෨ಂൿವฉದ ಪ౳ ൟൽನಃౙ  ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ກೋ౞ ವค 
೩ม౱ ච෽ಂൽಡ ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

XXX                           XXX                           XXX 
 

 

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SEVENTH SESSION 

 

THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF 

DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025 

(LA Bill No. 43 of 2025) 
 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation and Control 
of Development and Management) Act, 2011.  

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ground water 
(Regulation and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka 
Act 25 of 2011), for the purposes hereinafter appearing.  

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy-sixth year of 
the Republic of India as follows:  

1. Short title and commencement. (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation and Control of Development and 
Management) (Amendment) Act, 2025.  

(2) It shall come into force at once.  
2. Amendment of section 3. In the Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation 

and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 25 of 
2011) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub section (3),-  



 9 

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-  
"(a) The Secretary to Government incharge of the Minor Irrigation and 

Ground water development, Government of Karnataka who shall be the chair 
person."  

(ii) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:-  
“(b) The Director, Groundwater Directorate, who shall be the Member 

Secretary."  
(iii) for clause (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
“(f) The Chief Engineer, Rural Drinking Water and Sanitation Department.” 
(iv) for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
“(h) The Chief Engineer of south zone, Minor Irrigation and Groundwater 

Development Department.” 
 
3. Amendment of section 11.- In the principal Act, in section 11,- 
(i) For the heading, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
“11. Grant of permit to extract and use of Ground Water in Notified and 

Non-Notified Areas.",  
(ii) For sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
“(1) Subject to the provisions of any other law for time being in force relating 

to the protection of public sources of drinking water, no groundwater user, except 
those exempted under sub-section (1-A), shall drill or dig a well or extract, for any 
purpose in a notified and Non notified area without obtaining permit or No 
Objection Certificate from the Authority. 

(1-A). Categories of consumers who are exempted from obtaining permission 
or No Objection Certificate. The following categories of consumers shall be 
exempted from Obtaining Permit for drilling new Borewell and seeking No Objection 
Certificate for ground water extraction namely:-  

(i) Individual domestic consumers in both rural and urban areas for 
drinking water and domestic uses;  

(ii) Rural drinking water supply schemes;  
(iii) Armed Forces Establishments and Central Armed Police Forces 

establishments in both rural and urban areas;  
(iv) Agricultural activities; 
(v) All industries or mining projects or infrastructure projects drawing 

groundwater only for drinking or domestic purposes up to 5 Cum 
per day in all assessment units, and  

(vi) Residential apartments and group housing societies who drill or 
dig,- 
 

(a) For drinking water and domestic uses, drawing ground water 
up to 20 m3 per day subject to the conditions specified in the 
guidelines; and 

(b) Dwelling units for Economically Weaker Sections under the 
Government schemes.  



10 

(1-B) All private tankers abstracting ground water and use it for supply as 
bulk water suppliers shall have No Objection Certificate for ground water 
abstraction from the concerned authority as notified by the Government.” 

4. Amendment of section 17.- In the Principal Act, in section 17, in sub-
section (1), after clause (j), the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:-  

“(j-1) to issue, adopt and notify the guidelines issued by central groundwater 
authority for regulating and controlling the ground water extraction with suitable 
modifications; 

(j-2) to constitute the district committee or any committee for any area to 
implement the purpose of this Act; and 

 (j-3) to constitute a sub-committee consist of one or more members, experts 
from among themselves or outsiders to suggest or advice the authority in proper 
regulation or use of groundwater or in any other matter.” 

5. Amendment of section 18.- In the Principal Act, in section 18, for sub-
section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(3) The authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of 
ground water extracted for the use of commercial, industrial, mining projects, 
infrastructure projects and bulk water supply as notified by the Government on 
the basis of guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority.” 

6. Amendment of section 32.- In the Principal Act, in section 32,- 
(i) in sub-section (1),for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, 

namely:-  

“(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under 
clause (f) of sub-section (1) of section 17 of this Act:  
(i) Willfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such   

information or return; or 
(ii) Willfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or 

return which he knows to be false: 

- Shall be liable for punishment with penalty which may extend to Fifty 
thousand rupees. In the case of continuing and subsequent failure or 
contravention, an additional Penalty which may extend to one thousand 
rupees for every day during which such failure or contravention continues, 
shall be imposed.” 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "five thousand," the words "twenty five 
thousand", shall be substituted; 

 
(iii) in sub-section (4), for the words "ten thousand", the words "twenty five 

thousand", shall be substituted; and 
 

(iv) after sub-section (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
 



 11 

“(5) Any person extracts the water without obtaining valid No Objection 
Certificate and violates the provisions of this Act and said No Objection Certificate, 
punishable with penalty as notified by the Government on the basis of guidelines 
issued by the Central Ground Water Authority, with suitable modifications.” 

 
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 
 It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation 

and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011(Karnataka Act 25 of 2011) 

to,- 

(i)  give effect to the Budget Speech of Budget 2025-26; 
 

(ii) carry out the recommendations of the Administrative Reforms 

Commission-2;  
 

(iii) adopt the guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority, 

New Delhi; and  
 

 

(iv) adopt the provisions on the lines of the Jan Vishwas (Amendment of 

Provisions) Act, 2023 (Central Act 18 of 2023). 

      Hence, the Bill. 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure. 

 
N.S. BOSERAJU 

Minister for Minor Irrigation and 
Science and Technology 

 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly



12 

ANNEXURE 
THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF 

DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) ACT, 2011 
KARNATAKA ACT NO 25 OF 2011 

XXX    XXX    XXX 
 3. Establishment of Groundwater Authority.- XXX       XXX  XXX 
(3) The Authority shall consist of the following members, namely:- 

(a) The Secretary to Government in charge of the Department of Water 
resources, Minor Irrigation, Government of Karnataka who shall be the 
chairperson. 

(b) The Commissioner or Director of Mines and Geology, who shall be the 
Member Secretary. 

(c) A representative of the Finance Department, Government of 
Karnataka.  

(d) The Regional Director, Central Groundwater Board, Government of 
India.   

(e) One representative from the Electrical Supply Company having 
jurisdiction over the area, not below the rank of a Chief engineer. 

(f) The Chief Engineer, RDED, Rural Development and Panchayat Raj 
Department. 

(g) The Engineer-in-Chief, Water Resources Development Organization of 
Water Resources Department.   

(h) The Chief Engineer, Minor Irrigation, nominated by the Government. 
(i) The Chairman of the Karnataka State Pollution Control Board.   
(j) The Commissioner/Director of Agriculture, Department of Agriculture.   
(k) The Chief General Manager, National Bank for Agriculture and Rural 

Development, Bangalore.   
(l) Four representative of farmers to be nominated by the Government. 

(m) The Chief Engineer, the KUWS&DB. 
(n) The Chief Engineer, the BWSSB. 
(o) Two members who have special knowledge or practical experience in 

matters relating to groundwater to be nominated by the Government. 
 

XXX    XXX                        XXX 
11. Grant of permit to extract and use groundwater in the notified 

area.-  (1) Subject to the provisions of any law relating to protection of public 
sources of drinking water, any user of ground water desiring to drill or dig a well 
in the notified area for any purpose either on personal or community basis shall 
apply to the authority for grant of permit for this purpose and shall not proceed 
with any activity connected with such drilling or digging unless a permit has been 
granted by the authority.  

(2)  Every application under sub-section (1) shall be made in such form, 
shall contain such particulars and in such manner accompanied by such fee for 



 13 

different purposes like industrial, commercial entertainment, agricultural and 
domestic etc., and for different areas, as may be prescribed.  

XXX    XXX                        XXX 
17. Powers Of The Authority.-  (1) The authority or any person authorized 

by it in writing in this behalf shall have power,-  
(a) to enter at any reasonable time on any property and to investigate and 

take any measurement concerning the land or water located on the 
surface or underground;  

(b) to inspect the well which is being constructed or drilled or has been 
drilled and the soils and other materials excavated there from;  

(c) to take the specimens of such soils or other materials or of water 
extracted from such well; 

(d) to order in writing the person drilling or digging a well to keep and 
preserve in the prescribed manner specimen of soil or any material 
excavated there from for such period not exceeding three months from 
the date of completion or abandonment of the work as may be specified 
by the authority and thereupon such person shall comply with such 
requisition;  

(e) to inspect and to take copies of the relevant record or documents and 
to ask any question necessary for obtaining any information 
(including, diameter or depth of the well which is being or has been 
sunk, the level at which the water is or was struck and subsequently 
restored or rested the types of strata encountered in the drilling or 
digging of the well and quality of the water struck etc.,) required for 
carrying out the purposes of this Act;  

(f) to serve or cause to be served a notice requiring any user of 
groundwater or drilling or digging agency to furnish such information  
or returns in such form, at such intervals and with such particulars, 
as may be prescribed and thereupon such user or drilling or digging 
agency shall comply with such requisition;  

(g) to require the user of groundwater to install water measuring, devices 
if it is necessary to properly administer the water or there is reason to 
believe that the user of groundwater does not comply with the 
provisions of this act or the rules made thereunder or for any other 
sufficient reason: 
 provided that, where the user of groundwater does not comply 
with the direction issued to him within a period of thirty days, from the 
date of issue of such requisition the authority itself may install such 
water-measuring device and recover the cost from the defaulting user 
of groundwater;  

(h) to seize any mechanical equipment or device utilized for illegal drilling 
or digging of well and extraction of groundwater and to demolish the 
work executed fully or partly;  



14 

(i) to direct any user of groundwater who does not comply with the provisions 
of this act and the rules framed there under to close down the extraction 
of ground water, disconnect its power supply or confiscate any hydraulic 
work found to be illegal according to the provisions of this act and the rules 
made thereunder:  

provided that, where the user of groundwater does not comply with 
the direction  issued to him within a period of sixty days, from the date of 
issue of such requisition the authority itself may carry out the necessary 
work and recover the cost from the illegal user of groundwater;  

(j) to enter and search at all reasonable times with such assistance, if any, as 
it considers necessary, any place in which it has reason to believe that 
offence under this act has  been or is being committed and to order in 
writing the person who has or is committing the offence not to extract or 
use the groundwater for a specified period not exceeding thirty days;  

(k) to exercise such other powers as may be prescribed or as may be necessary 
for carrying out the purposes of this act or any rules made thereunder. 

XXX    XXX                        XXX 
18.  Funds of the Authority.-XXX       XXX                   XXX 
(3) The Authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of ground 

water extracted for industrial, commercial and entertainment purposes with the 
approval of the government in such manner as may be prescribed. 

XXX    XXX    XXX 
32. Offences and penalties.-  (1) any person or drilling or digging agency 

who,-  
(a)  obstructs the authority or any other person authorized by it to exercise 

any of the powers under this act; or   
(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under clause 

(f) of sub-section (1) of section 17: 
(i) wilfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such 

information or return; or  
(ii)    wilfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or return 

which he knows to be false;  
shall be liable for punishment with fine which may extend to five thousand rupees 
and/or imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months or both.  in the 
case of continuing and subsequent failure or contravention, an additional fine 
which may extend to one hundred rupees for every day during which such failure 
or contravention continues, shall be imposed. 

XXX    XXX    XXX 
 

 

  

 

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2025-08-16T18:04:04+0530
	THAMMAIAH




