S X n%

ORTITN TFLIXRT
cDZ’an oo B3

TN -9 2BOMERD, WFTT, O& BNE, 9098 (JWIe9 99, FFIHE O€PL) To. 9L
Part —IVA BENGALURU, WEDNESDAY, 13 AUGUST, 2025 (SHRAVANA 22, SHAKAVARSHA 1947) No.476

TR 3T PO
TATOTIRE NPeRDYS
NPRe W[

FOoFEdT 903 (93,0, DI, AVFBBVBOD dDODN DN TONP

N0H03)9) (3T RBB) IG3CoD T, 2025
(20253 QgesEEod Dgeods Bosd-43)

TOOEET 03%E® (933D, NI, DBEBHBOD )OS NS
QDONO0IZ)E9) LRI 201130, aNI R, BT FTE 20BN 20T LIGLONT.

Q). Y3,300T FORBIWTIT ST LBNLMON TooeedT 9032 (€92)33,0,
DI, DVEBBOD DTS TNR  DONO0ZD) PRI, 20113 (20113
TOOEEITE 9RDODED 25) 3T e300TIY)T3 OB 200 NBIe)TDOTS;

QR PTI N0 OR,ITSE NDREBC).  ToorddT Doy
LDOTENOBORDOT 8 2NI0DTOIZ IR O33N ;-

1. FOBRW, BRIV DI), ®YT0PW.- (1) & LRPRIAODENTI,, ToEET
903%WED (9B, NI, NBEJBHBO IO TaNe DON0IZ)e) (ST )
9D, 2025 0T FBONIT,TN,.

(2) VR B8 TRBEK DN WT3T,T, .

2. B399 30 W BB.- Tooe&dT 9032 (TR, aNI), De3e BFBOD
AONDS TN ACDOZED) IRAOND, 2011 (JL), QTEN0T DR
L9 ONNIOT) NE3 DR INS)T 33¢ BTTEAT (3)C¢ NRTTT LT -

(i) DOTR ()T VBN B8 ED0RITTRN,, 3O3R IT,T3),, DOTIT:-

©



)

() ATIETT TIONEWIE, RO, DT 30I), LIOIVES 93D, YO,
FTOOEEIT ATOE T, Ye30) LIPsFONTIT,T),,."

(i) DOTW (V)T TN B8 0T TRN, 313 03C3RIT,T3),, NOTT:-

"(2J) AWETTDR, 03 %WED QAT E T O, RIN oM RTRs
TOONETDEOINTIF,E3),,."

(iii) DOT ()T WTWN B3 T0DTT, T3 RBRCB AT, DOTT:-

"(2de%) 23€5° YOLBRORNTE, NMyedILEd TTOINES L3 aNIBY, FyaNeDs B0 83.”

(iv) DOT (223°%)T TWDN B3 TODTTI, &) S3ABRERBA ST, DOTWT:-

") 23C° BOBIAODT®, B0 OO, XD, 003D 03, 0IBED
€903y, A"

3. B30 118 SWIBR.- 2R 9RICNNT 113¢ RT3, -

(i) DEAFTN WTN BT 2DIODTTR, B3OSR RITLLI),, DOTIT:-

"11. OPIRWBIS D3I) DIAPWITOE IICBTS), o3WFOTN,
3rRohe) D3, WFIT) 933 ACRF.-"

(i) @VBTTTD (1)T WTWN B3 TODITTN, B3RV RCBAIT,T,, NOTT:-

(1) DRONE AOT  ATEBIT  aDRONE  ROTTHBNR  AOWORNATOI
330,03, FDAND e B3T 00T TIPS MTBWOFNPNR 2WwFRE,, (1)
NWRTTEITIC AN S BET3eT I, BRTIVTEA), O30T 903826 FTLOTN,
DYRDTOCROT BINNS VWONT BRTI) G0 LGP0 DU TT00 B33,
R LTDAT BRTVI) ODRIABI 9T IPNINRBITOE IJITED), 0303
B LITO,N 250eI0NT), FRTONIT,T.L), 9w 3LEBIT,EBL)..

(1) oDeH3 P ATIRCFTH I IBOITTO0T dvecdh 3
RBOD VT MYBFTV RWBNFNYND.- BPRA FRFP WeIONR, TRTONN 9:30a03
BVBOPT DI, ©O3HED 3RO AUIEFo Y TRCAHTOOT
LVOON AT, WS NENF) B8 &DI0RNT03eS, DOTWT:-

() DDROINT B DI, My® WFINPH NMYedXD DI, SNJ
S TBNSCBOOR, 530083 NyEBTOSEN NBFO;

(i) MYedICED THEONES T FTTO2) 2,La0NSD;

(ifi) TR0 DB, INT FTEBNSTROES ITR, BBOD FToODEROR, AT
D3, FEODYLOD BTF,, FROCT BINYF FoODEROR, MDD

(iv) Ty LFENTEITNRYD;



a

(v) 903z 3NN TV DY, TyMRDTNY) 95300 NPT DB TN
OB DDPOARPTONE DYBTENY D9, IFPEDATW PETNAPR FTEBO BHEOES
90 My WPTOD NWLINPNMN 3503 )8 DIT, 55 JICEIT® 3T, 03,

(Vi) TRTBONIGTI 03I, 3R TN B3RS 9aEIEN0EINS) D3I, Ny
ReNRT RRRLEINDD,-

() TR eI, MyD WFINLMON, 00NERRBNF), ADER BRI
ROZNPNR 2WwFBED, )8 DTT, 20 FS NET NFRSTNR 903263, SRORT;
PAWEN

() BTIED A,LaNFE BSRET 00N TNWED BNETWROMONTIER 3A 3 R EITNALD.

"(12)) 903%EETT), BRTINONE NI, CIW), WRT, T30 T3C). ¢TI
ACWVTTIDCTN  ATV0IL) 2008 D, DIAN E30;0TONY), ATIETo)
DR B RWTITOZ AOWOPHE, DYPTOCROT 903 HEQ BRTINONTT,N
ATT LT BI)ed3), BRODTIT,,."

4. R0 178 AW J/B.- DR BRIRDNDT 173 JyF3T  (1)3¢
VTRTTEITE) BE3 (23) DORBT 3300 8% V0D ITR, AEDRIT,T,, DOTT:-

"(2-1) ©9032:6© BRTINONIYTWR, DO NAD 203, DODO0Z R FCOT)
O3WEQ DYPTOTeY) BRTBRAT ONEARWNFI), ALRT, 00 BINEPON
BRVRAIT,RY,, BWFBRATRL,ITRE), a0, PAPBRIT,ET),,;

(23-2) 88 9RIODENT AT LBNP ), FTOONENINRPP R 00T T3 To,N
22039, Reddd eI 00T R30I, BWRIT,T),,; =03,

(23-3) OIBEDOTW FINTJET DODO0IFD NI, WPT 9GP0 O /3T
LRODNF ) 9ZBINY By 8 €953200 BRTNTRBD O DYPTOTF, AT ILTBEN EITI 0
RSB ROD)  OW) T H,S ABRFT), IO, BRODTIES V-
230D, BBR3T,E,."

5. BT0d 180 STHRBV.- e IRIONTNT 183¢ TyTTT WA 83
FODTTIN, &3 ABRERAITE),, DOTWT:-

"(3) TCOTY) 903 HED WP TOTag) BRTRATIE aONE RRWBNY ST 0¢e3
0£3%5, ZNMOOT, NEAMEDT O3B INED, tHRORRTONE O3CLINS) eI, AFoE Teg)
ODARWBATO3 WRW, Tt OB) ATWORS  WFIMN  BRTIN00E
I0IBEDT &WjadIoLT BN HTYPTTeg) ART, WONFP,, IR WIBIT.”

6. B T09 320 3WI_RBR.- 30R LINIONNT 323¢ ByTTLTE),, -
(i) UET-&yTTEd (1)3 (2J) DOTWT WM B8 NI0RITRN,, B3O8/ RIT,T3,,.

() B ORARNTDT 173 TJTTRE (1) VR -TTTEIE  (FF) DO
90N, C0EYTIE 230308 €9TIz00 eJadT BWIjas )y WBNA) INI;BRRCIINT),, -



®

() ©OF VWod BB WRTBIRD, WBNILD NBLS FPSE TaooN
QUFTDATT G50 TOSRD T3, FOTEI LI GV AT ; €950

(i) 03PR)TC 20308 IFWP Je3T VWIad), LIT AP, D0WITIN 3LTR
NBLT FRTE TN 2WBNABT 953800 2BNRE FoTEILIT ;

- 80e33), AT CRTICNNPRCNR A DARWBITOE COBDOT WOLRINaN3T,T3),.
VOFTION)  ZNOTNTDOET AOWREEWED), aNI), 3FWONT  IPOI  ITTad0
OOTICD FOWEERE), 90T FOIAN) €900 SOTION) 0TS TT
FT)3DTF, AT CRTICNNYN IR DAWIITINE 302,30 OB, cdPRIT,T,.

(i) VBTTTeD (R)TADE “8T3) AeIT TRTIONNFP TN 02 JWNY
TN Q& 3,403 AT BRTIOINF TN 202 BWNF N, 803 RRIT,T),,;

(i) SVBITTD (4)3)TVE "®BI), AT TBRDIONNFRTNR" 0w JWNY
TN "QT,3, 4730 W)V BRDIOINF TN 202 BWNP,, 3O3R RIT,,,;
D3I,

(iv) VRT3 (4)3 3323003 B3 ZNV0RITTWIY, ALDRIT,T,, DOTWT:-

“(5) A0TNWOTW QUOEFTO B3, BVBONT BRTI)  ABI),
3r1030E3 303, T3 LRONRNT NBWWOGBNFI, a0, RO DTIF LT BIje3cd),
MO0 OB B[sFONY  FCOL) IOSHED  DPToTey) BRTBAT
ZINE APV NY S3HOTE 303 ART, 2300 BINFLRODN ATOE T LIRAPBATOT
BOBINLRODR BOLIVINIT,T),."

T LINYH H3), FoONY BCLTF
TOOERT WOBWED  (WPHD), D), DBEBBOD )OS TN

AODO0Z)  IRPAODED, 2011 (20113 TOEFELTEW PRI 253, &8
FNODTINPMN T3 e300C3IeHT) €9e3B5Fe30T3) WONLBRIONGS, -

(i) 2025-263 €303023503) 270830330, DN RPRITHT;

(i) ©S3BPI3 RIPOTO 303/0¢N-23 dPOTARI NF ), oONRITIIHTY;

(i) TCOW 03HEFD DYPIT, BVRARBD®D, W[IBd BRTRAT
SINERRBNFI, BFSRATRR,HT; eI,

(iv)  ZSDTA (VBWOPNY 3T BB) PAOGDRD, 2023 (20233
FLOTYIRPI 0NN 18)T 930A0T SVFBWOPNP R, LIPS BATRI ).

€333 00T B3 LITFCODT.



3

SDFT 20,88 VI
TWA,e)3 TOAVOIT Tjaday) O0e)TH 3023, 8323,8330, WwPRRORTIYN)..

NT®. DEFS. WRCITD20
€9, D030, eI, 03I,
303, S D03

N0.3. SNEESE A
TOONFTEE
BIOF 3T WO

eodhrwoy
TOoF 8T 03 RFO® (9T, DI, AWFBHBOD dDOD NS ToNP
QON03)£9) LI AONED, 2011 (20118 TP EITTW 9P AODD 25)3 N, 43 on
XXX XXX XXX
3. 903 WF® TYDTOVW TwFa3.- XXX XXX XXX
(3) TRDTOTP) B8 0D IWI;BINY'), BRODTITE,T), HOTWT:-

() ATFTW TONFWIE, BOROBJINL YOLB, R, T30,
FTOOEEIT ATIE T, Ye3B) LIPsFTONTIT, T,
() D TNIY, BRI, E3ONTT) I DTREITT), BeIB) AR5
TOONEWAEOINTIF,3),,;
(R) TUEEIT ATE VT BRET YUB0D 22,30 &83D;
(B3) TYTIDT ATCEJTT), FLOTW) LI0IHES sNOWP, 23003 ATOE T,
(V) BIW S 9RTOT @950.03NY, IT353° ATWTO) FOWO
2305° QORIAODT® BEENOI FLDODD T W, &8Y;
() VB YOBIONT?!, ST RBD, NI, D3I,
FTOFOONI® Do YIS,
(23) BOLRODNT® Y 23CeD°, BOAOBWSSRLL QIR 25OROT SR ONY
€92)3, 8, ROA,;
(DF¥) Ty ATOETeY DOTNITEDRIET 23657° QYORIONTY, =€,
DCT0 ;
(80) 35T, TFRREET Tos 33005 DON0I)E NOTBE;
() Ty EBSONTRD / AWREITT, Ty QOOS;
(B) VY5 eI TJWORT, ToRQ,LOD Ty DI, NMeyeddTo0)a3,D),
230503T°%, LONLRTY;
(07) To%5 RTOE V) MO ITEED RIS Do, 6 TyS TSIPNYD;
(€20) 23€E° BOBRODTE, FIEEIT SNT AT FT20T02) a0 3D, €92)a3, 8,
DDOBY;
(%) 23¢p° YORBDONT?, LONKRTI E3B) ATW0022) aNI), WwFWTOT
DDOBY;



&

(20) ARTOFTaY) DONITLEDRIE €903BESD ROWORT dRONNYE).
KB INHWPT 9T DYASRINT 9T BRODTIE B,

RER TN
XXX XXX XXX
11. ©DPIRWBI JWCIRBS), @oldwroxmd, I3ncdhen D3I, WwFIeN
ORDIOD ACRF.- (1) DDRONE OS] AREEBIT  :DRONY  ROTFTHWN

ROWORNATW O0RPYT  TOSRIS VB WOPNLRAFITEY,, 0I03P, IOIWED
WPTTT), a30NTT 95300 RedNWI0NT  FTOD Ozt B LIT,N
9RNRRLE 3 FICIT ), 230N, TRTCDEN 953200 3B 9, ATE) , 333 &3
NBLIT,N 9NN, TRED TYRNTTF, REODT, AN AIT,T), w3,
DYRTOCDOT  IINNIONT), VBEW HDRTID Tl TRTABNYTF, I
3R TT, ROWORAT O WENBEITR 3PBNITE.L)..

2) (NI NBZBTLRTRONAT 3O3R0 IRBEONT), BT, 200325
RDIRCOBS, T aNIY, MyPTYIs a0I0TE XT3 NBL3NPMeN, X3 23¢3
FBRLMON DONNFWTBITOTOT OB B3N, OT RBVNPIPRPOT
€903 DE30ONE). TN €90 SNRICNE). B AJT,T3),.

XXX XXX XXX

17. @03 RF® HYDNTOOTW HDTIONAP).- (1) TYPRTOTeY) T &8 W,
OTD0T DNIT IPTOC VW O30, 3530300 B8 30T LIPTITNPN,
BRODTIT,T, -

() OYTE R, SRBRYT, O0eYTE ReNOHA ReNONTE), Tya3tdRITHT) eI,
FOWARDAT PR 90 00D a3, 40D, 90 23000
£90300FTE). YB3 DO TOICO 2330 T3 ToOTIe €9TT O30T LIP3,
SRTTRP,)T;

() DedERVT 9T TRTONEIVTS €930 SHNMINESE TRTDTIES 2I0e) O,
NI, TOOTW INRT 3NRT &0, TN BIT BRL,NF Y, WO RITHTI;

(2) 90T 230eIANOT BRTVINRE 90T DB 90 Y3 [RINY €9T3e30
ALOR eTONPN,, FWRBAHT;

(&) WD, TRV TNE 9IG0 3/LrI3 B0 353,030 9IBDOT 3R
BT €930 039033t BRALNT e3BDONT),, FORTT), BPDERPPAC 900
20830,20&3,, DIJ0TROTW aNRTY 30NPNR LEBTWOT 9e3D0ONTNA, DOV
De3oH &), P TT) ADE R, BDBRAWBITIETOI BLILELFTOT D3I,
ROV FETOR) DDI 333 ALWIHT a0IY, €3 3T220003 IOT 353,030 ooN
I35 BRI, DODRIFTY,;

(B) B8 9DIAANDT NTLINFD, ToODENINRPID) AFOWORAIT o3
OO  BAYKHING TSNP, O AT 2D, WBONYTD  oaNe
(FRTONI TN 900 3CEBIZTVE T SPCRT 2300 oA 9ITTw0 €3,
AR, BF INRTIN A3 A3,3) ToNe IWS03T O30 S3PT, A3 3)02) D033,
23000, 3CTBIZ TN AT, eI R BWEINY WD 03I, DO MIDE,
QRINE) wFNRPOBOI) O0YHT 39030 30N, BBODL) 93T TS O30T
&BF,003), FCEHHT ;

(RF*) BOIBEDT OI0IRW, WPTROCR G0 230e) IPTOINNG ITa00
38T HB),0300 DO EDTITVTOT 233030300, 9T RBTDNPD, 0T
TERRIONE). 905 FTo0ITNRFE). eNI), 90T IRBTNERODR 2wBNRLILFTOT



&

IN3;BRAIE WOTD S[PCEIEAT), WD [PWIT) 9Fw 220D 230003
WY aNI), Tt oD RWAN €3 WFFTLT 9IGF0 Wde) ITRTO
953200 3CTIE D) O e9IN3; BBATOT L90INPRD, DODRIT,TY,,;

() OO WFTOD BBPIE, ~DON B 9P 903%WED
WFTDOTI) 8 9RDIONTNGE B WOFPNF D), 9B W3 e9BONE). TFAT
QODRINF D), DDA DOT FOWE TOTLINPT T €950 O30 T3¢ A3T ART,
FOTLINPMON 93T TAW T BO 0BRSS AR, PRBRAIE0Z 0IBED
WFTLOTII), INB5BTAIHTI0:

FWO0ID), B0IHED WFTRITI) 3N AR ATEIINFD, 2033, DING
9B RPNR DDA, DTYRTTe) IONONL 90T B VBN AV eIy
IPTRRWIBIT) aNIY, TNt WODALN 3D, 90IZHEE WFTROTIOT 232333730y
RPD) VT WIIT.

(A2F°%) TPV TeON  2WAe)ONT), FAPTODL) T SRCBR NI,
OIHEDEI, 3NONSD  BA3RENAT OPYTE  ONOIRLEWTTLANT I,
ZR.NOTWITYT) aNI), DeIEPACIIT TONMDONR, LIONT eI PLIE 00N
VOTRBEAIHT.

(80) &3 IPRIADINT  NVTJWOPNPTD, 30I), T3 BODC).  TBAT
AODIINFI),  DODIT O33R, LOIBE® WFTWITI), 003
£9032EOT, 303 IRANRTN, DD FLRTOTD, €9TWT, IT5I* FTWTOWR),
33),TOFTLILFTOT LITIe00 B9 LIPIONTNTI LITIeT0 €ITIT €9 ONE). T2 AT DODINY
RBR TOTRT 2030TOT) FOBIWOT CO0YTE TyBYDT® TaNMD O,
DIBRATRTINTOR) INB5BERIHTI:

W30, 903%ED WFTWOCI 33N ABT AWEIINY, 90T TT3,00
FRLDTONTD, BRTBRAT DIV0TROR 98I, DINY 9BPRBRPT ToODINTL),
DYPRTOCe) TN  BTT  TeMEDONI,;  FNRFOTVE) DI,
TR0 T I0IZWEE WHFTLOTOT SITT 2323,53030, SRR a3I0TI0TIT.

(@) 88 ORIRNDNT LRODAS  IVOIFRSY,  2VOBINT 9T
FIRBIMIE DO IJoF) SOWEN TOGLNPTE O R FSI), I
9T TR0 P0e)RWTBIDOWOT ITeIIJRODR D),  ART,  AeNONTE).
BJ3ARITH T a0, BRCRRITHT) eI, CITWOVTFeIYy, e00TTS €90 2330T8Y3,B0e3
BB DPRTI), DINPR ECT 20T DDEFR,, LRRONE), e9032EDTI),
3RONTO3 90 WFABOI3 DNITWE). e3TLARIYTI);

(T) 88 RIONINT 9TTe00 9T 9RONE), BB AT DODIINE N L3NF,
FHBCOAIR BTN DONNTWTIWOE BT 93T sTONWIIIWOG 93T
ODTOTNF I, WIANRITY)TI.

XXX XXX XXX

18. T DTOTT APNAPH.- XXX XXX XXX

) @YDNTTeY), RIVETVE IFDBRLEBISLODT FMODF, 20082 03,
DIRCOBS B L3NPMIN IRODIE OIBEDTW Tyl  «0te3
QO WTBITOTOT DEI0DNE). ART, WONF Y, LdRDIWIBIT.

XXX XXX XXX

32. HROIFPNY) DNI), BOBNP.- (1) CLIRW,, HOIBEDT WFTLOTI

e9T3209 239ed) TRTOIEI/3CTBIES £25a) O3, -



9)

(D) DYPRTOTT, BT LHTDOTW LPTIC VW Oeg@), V3T 531 B
9RACNTNT RO S O0YTE IPNTITNPTD, WERONAL) 9B BRATT,
(SIAAD)

() 173¢ FTTW (1) NBV-JyTTDT (DF°) VORBT RBONE). O30l
309008 €953299 )3T WIjadddy WwBNAE) eINB;TBRR DN, -

(i) @07 w0dd PP IRBTRI B, WENAIL) B LT  TPSE TaooN
QUTOATT 9T230 TOSRI) T3, TOTEDID TX SV AT ; 95300

(i) 00T 3008 I IV BIjed), T AY), DOWITN SPTWR
N LT BRRETN 2WEBNATT 95330 WBNAL) FTTLIVOTT ;

- 80330 AT CRTIOINPRTN LIRDRWITBITIOE ZICTON a0I), / 9P 33D
OMPINY PPN IR DRWTIWOE  FToU0I0A IOFNR  OFd0  9I30BIN,
MDONST,T),. POOFTION)  2NOTWROT FOWFERE). I, IT000NT
LTI 9T P OFTIORN FOTIFETE). TN €3 IFOIOIN LITaI0 SV OFIFOD
RNORNRTTEW F3DIT, <SRBT  CRTIOINDNR dXDIVTINE BLR,e30
2,30 BOLRITINIT,T3),.

XXX XXX XXX

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

SEVENTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF
DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(LA Bill No. 43 of 2025)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation and Control
of Development and Management) Act, 2011.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ground water
(Regulation and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka
Act 25 of 2011), for the purposes hereinafter appearing.

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy-sixth year of
the Republic of India as follows:

1. Short title and commencement. (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation and Control of Development and
Management) (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3. In the Karnataka Ground Water (Regulation
and Control of Development and Management) Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 25 of
2011) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub section (3),-



¢

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(a) The Secretary to Government incharge of the Minor Irrigation and
Ground water development, Government of Karnataka who shall be the chair
person."

(ii) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(b) The Director, Groundwater Directorate, who shall be the Member
Secretary."

(iii) for clause (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(f) The Chief Engineer, Rural Drinking Water and Sanitation Department.”

(iv) for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(h) The Chief Engineer of south zone, Minor Irrigation and Groundwater
Development Department.”

3. Amendment of section 11.- In the principal Act, in section 11,-

(i) For the heading, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“11. Grant of permit to extract and use of Ground Water in Notified and
Non-Notified Areas.",

(ii) For sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Subject to the provisions of any other law for time being in force relating
to the protection of public sources of drinking water, no groundwater user, except
those exempted under sub-section (1-A), shall drill or dig a well or extract, for any
purpose in a notified and Non notified area without obtaining permit or No
Objection Certificate from the Authority.

(1-A). Categories of consumers who are exempted from obtaining permission
or No Objection Certificate. The following categories of consumers shall be
exempted from Obtaining Permit for drilling new Borewell and seeking No Objection
Certificate for ground water extraction namely:-

(i) Individual domestic consumers in both rural and urban areas for
drinking water and domestic uses;

(i) Rural drinking water supply schemes;

(iii) Armed Forces Establishments and Central Armed Police Forces
establishments in both rural and urban areas;

(iv) Agricultural activities;

(v) All industries or mining projects or infrastructure projects drawing
groundwater only for drinking or domestic purposes up to S Cum
per day in all assessment units, and

(vi) Residential apartments and group housing societies who drill or
dig,-

(a) For drinking water and domestic uses, drawing ground water
up to 20 m3 per day subject to the conditions specified in the
guidelines; and

(b) Dwelling units for Economically Weaker Sections under the
Government schemes.



00

(1-B) All private tankers abstracting ground water and use it for supply as
bulk water suppliers shall have No Objection Certificate for ground water
abstraction from the concerned authority as notified by the Government.”

4. Amendment of section 17.- In the Principal Act, in section 17, in sub-
section (1), after clause (j), the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:-

“(-1) to issue, adopt and notify the guidelines issued by central groundwater
authority for regulating and controlling the ground water extraction with suitable
modifications;

(j-2) to constitute the district committee or any committee for any area to
implement the purpose of this Act; and

(j-3) to constitute a sub-committee consist of one or more members, experts
from among themselves or outsiders to suggest or advice the authority in proper
regulation or use of groundwater or in any other matter.”

5. Amendment of section 18.- In the Principal Act, in section 18, for sub-
section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) The authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of
ground water extracted for the use of commercial, industrial, mining projects,
infrastructure projects and bulk water supply as notified by the Government on
the basis of guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority.”

6. Amendment of section 32.- In the Principal Act, in section 32,-

(i) in sub-section (1),for clause (b), the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under
clause (f) of sub-section (1) of section 17 of this Act:
(i) Willfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such
information or return; or
(i) Willfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or
return which he knows to be false:

- Shall be liable for punishment with penalty which may extend to Fifty
thousand rupees. In the case of continuing and subsequent failure or
contravention, an additional Penalty which may extend to one thousand
rupees for every day during which such failure or contravention continues,
shall be imposed.”
(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "five thousand," the words "twenty five
thousand", shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (4), for the words "ten thousand", the words "twenty five
thousand", shall be substituted; and

(iv) after sub-section (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:-



Q0

“(5) Any person extracts the water without obtaining valid No Objection
Certificate and violates the provisions of this Act and said No Objection Certificate,
punishable with penalty as notified by the Government on the basis of guidelines
issued by the Central Ground Water Authority, with suitable modifications.”

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ground water (Regulation
and Control of Development and Management) Act, 201 1(Karnataka Act 25 of 2011)
to,-
(i) give effect to the Budget Speech of Budget 2025-26;
(ii) carry out the recommendations of the Administrative Reforms
Commission-2;
(iii) adopt the guidelines issued by the Central Ground Water Authority,
New Delhi; and
(iv) adopt the provisions on the lines of the Jan Vishwas (Amendment of

Provisions) Act, 2023 (Central Act 18 of 2023).

Hence, the Bill.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.

N.S. BOSERAJU
Minister for Minor Irrigation and
Science and Technology

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



0

ANNEXURE
THE KARNATAKA GROUND WATER (REGULATION AND CONTROL OF

DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT) ACT, 2011
KARNATAKA ACT NO 25 OF 2011
XXX XXX XXX
3. Establishment of Groundwater Authority.- XXX XXX XXX
(3) The Authority shall consist of the following members, namely:-

(a) The Secretary to Government in charge of the Department of Water
resources, Minor Irrigation, Government of Karnataka who shall be the
chairperson.

(b) The Commissioner or Director of Mines and Geology, who shall be the
Member Secretary.

(c) A representative of the Finance Department, Government of
Karnataka.

(d) The Regional Director, Central Groundwater Board, Government of
India.

(e) One representative from the Electrical Supply Company having
jurisdiction over the area, not below the rank of a Chief engineer.

(f) The Chief Engineer, RDED, Rural Development and Panchayat Raj
Department.

(g) The Engineer-in-Chief, Water Resources Development Organization of
Water Resources Department.

(h) The Chief Engineer, Minor Irrigation, nominated by the Government.

(i) The Chairman of the Karnataka State Pollution Control Board.

(j) The Commissioner/Director of Agriculture, Department of Agriculture.

(k) The Chief General Manager, National Bank for Agriculture and Rural
Development, Bangalore.

(I) Four representative of farmers to be nominated by the Government.

(m) The Chief Engineer, the KUWS&DB.

(n) The Chief Engineer, the BWSSB.

(0) Two members who have special knowledge or practical experience in
matters relating to groundwater to be nominated by the Government.

XXX XXX XXX

11. Grant of permit to extract and use groundwater in the notified
area.- (1) Subject to the provisions of any law relating to protection of public
sources of drinking water, any user of ground water desiring to drill or dig a well
in the notified area for any purpose either on personal or community basis shall
apply to the authority for grant of permit for this purpose and shall not proceed
with any activity connected with such drilling or digging unless a permit has been
granted by the authority.

(2) Every application under sub-section (1) shall be made in such form,
shall contain such particulars and in such manner accompanied by such fee for



(@F:S

different purposes like industrial, commercial entertainment, agricultural and
domestic etc., and for different areas, as may be prescribed.

XXX XXX XXX

17. Powers Of The Authority.- (1) The authority or any person authorized
by it in writing in this behalf shall have power,-
(a) to enter at any reasonable time on any property and to investigate and

take any measurement concerning the land or water located on the
surface or underground;

(b) to inspect the well which is being constructed or drilled or has been

drilled and the soils and other materials excavated there from,;

(c) to take the specimens of such soils or other materials or of water

extracted from such well;

(d) to order in writing the person drilling or digging a well to keep and

preserve in the prescribed manner specimen of soil or any material
excavated there from for such period not exceeding three months from
the date of completion or abandonment of the work as may be specified
by the authority and thereupon such person shall comply with such
requisition;

(e) to inspect and to take copies of the relevant record or documents and

to ask any question necessary for obtaining any information
(including, diameter or depth of the well which is being or has been
sunk, the level at which the water is or was struck and subsequently
restored or rested the types of strata encountered in the drilling or
digging of the well and quality of the water struck etc.,) required for
carrying out the purposes of this Act;

to serve or cause to be served a notice requiring any user of
groundwater or drilling or digging agency to furnish such information
or returns in such form, at such intervals and with such particulars,
as may be prescribed and thereupon such user or drilling or digging
agency shall comply with such requisition;

(g) to require the user of groundwater to install water measuring, devices

if it is necessary to properly administer the water or there is reason to
believe that the user of groundwater does not comply with the
provisions of this act or the rules made thereunder or for any other
sufficient reason:

provided that, where the user of groundwater does not comply
with the direction issued to him within a period of thirty days, from the
date of issue of such requisition the authority itself may install such
water-measuring device and recover the cost from the defaulting user
of groundwater;

(h) to seize any mechanical equipment or device utilized for illegal drilling

or digging of well and extraction of groundwater and to demolish the
work executed fully or partly;



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297 oY

(i) to direct any user of groundwater who does not comply with the provisions
of this act and the rules framed there under to close down the extraction
of ground water, disconnect its power supply or confiscate any hydraulic
work found to be illegal according to the provisions of this act and the rules
made thereunder:

provided that, where the user of groundwater does not comply with
the direction issued to him within a period of sixty days, from the date of
issue of such requisition the authority itself may carry out the necessary
work and recover the cost from the illegal user of groundwater;

(j) to enter and search at all reasonable times with such assistance, if any, as
it considers necessary, any place in which it has reason to believe that
offence under this act has been or is being committed and to order in
writing the person who has or is committing the offence not to extract or
use the groundwater for a specified period not exceeding thirty days;

(k) to exercise such other powers as may be prescribed or as may be necessary
for carrying out the purposes of this act or any rules made thereunder.

XXX XXX XXX
18. Funds of the Authority.-XXX XXX XXX
(3) The Authority may impose appropriate charges on the quantum of ground
water extracted for industrial, commercial and entertainment purposes with the
approval of the government in such manner as may be prescribed.
XXX XXX XXX
32. Offences and penalties.- (1) any person or drilling or digging agency
who,-
(a) obstructs the authority or any other person authorized by it to exercise
any of the powers under this act; or
(b) having been required to furnish any information or return under clause
(f) of sub-section (1) of section 17:
(i) wilfully refuses or without lawful excuse, neglects to furnish such
information or return; or
(ii) wilfully furnishes or causes to be furnished any information or return
which he knows to be false;
shall be liable for punishment with fine which may extend to five thousand rupees
and/or imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months or both. in the
case of continuing and subsequent failure or contravention, an additional fine
which may extend to one hundred rupees for every day during which such failure
or contravention continues, shall be imposed.
XXX XXX XXX

BBBD Harte BFeBBTR:- FoBVTPTONW, BJeFLIZ DIRDI), JFBorFD Beor) Tmevod, orideth

THAMMAIAH



		2025-08-16T18:04:04+0530
	THAMMAIAH




