o

RNI No. RARBIL/2001/47147

merie oo TeLTT,

@@%&W\ 56&3,»&:3:3::53
2deq 0oty BJS

P03-IVA doriee, shotdsed, drest 9¢, J0n2 @ 02, 33 Jme NFa) Fo. 208
Part-IVA Bengaluru, Tuesday, March 28, 2017 (Chaitra 07, Shaka Varsha 1938) No. 305
TOWFT BWITHOOD
(ETaY A5

.‘5033& Y] 72 QOFYL3 2013, Bonwndy, dF08: 27-03-2017

19460 BXnens woideenns (R sBe3nsh) soodHod (deordw 19460 Fo0% o, XX)
OO 158 wvTdoo (1)s@oD ONZIDT0oZ 20098 BJ0FE3F 30T QLBRENNY (GIw
s88e3nh) AoPTION AIB IV wWRRABI No: Y 282 2R 2009, Bonwedd,
Ose08: 07.12.200980% TTFLE TonRIIW  FOn-IV-ACY T, ITO IR ©PReUIR
LORITIMHBVT BFeTBAD Hone ,ooaim?emddo QY VORRWS Tswmern 30 DINLRHMN
AQA  FooFEs OonIIRY TpWA CTRRCRNBR. AFO TonBIFH) FoBFIITONR  DJ003:
07.12.200980T0 e)zﬁsmﬂcbgd.

RGO ComTIW TFWHA ALFI0D CFEIR Tonep AOINEI, T,  RFoFCsy) TonwesSH
BREROBDBT. Toren 19460 Bueend edaennd (Fpod suie3niw) seodod (3e0mm 19467
590 xoaj’é XX) soo 158 evIzeo (1)88 BRZB @@ﬂdasz&el BTN BIoEEIT Doz,
RGOy B8 §930BOZ AODTPBYOD), T2IATHBT.

Nohbnish

L dears B @doy - (I) IO JdodIRTeodI, 20173 Bdnens POBRLTRB (RO
STEBRW)(STHNTA) AODTPIPY O ﬁdo&w&mhﬁoéd

(i) 83 DODTPTOOID FTFO Toz, TIBQ TBeIoT DT0FNOT WOR WIIT.

2. obRRU-15 I - 19610 FTOFLET  BERNS Uudfaﬁcz{ﬁq (TR0 ©cieBried)
DODIRIE0H  eZPRAB-1 8

() ToERg B3y Ouy PO, BeOHTAAG BIOFEY HPTO D STy BOSS”
ANT dear FohAOLY FoDI-3(1): @ T F0BF 15-0 0O ITROIHE “58 SHFAWD” P20
TORD Tone ©03NG WBUPA “60 ITFND” 0 ZeToDLE.

Scanned by CamScanner ”



2

(i) ToF[sexdron Bewd A0 STBeBNWD’ DoW  SearoRBODNY, VOPI-3(1): WT soRd
22-20Q TINOABHE “58 IRFAD” S0 T[nth Tone wodNe wWBoRN 60 T[HRENWT
QRO TSIV,

TIFLIT TORIPOT SBETIRTT B, VSO HIOTQ.

QO.Q%C. HLFOBLIDUD
BFFOB oI FooRFTdF -1,
FONET QOI.

LABOUR SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
No: LD 72 LET 2013, Bengaluru, Dated: 27-03-2017

Whereas the draft of the the Karnataka Industrial Employment (Standing Orders)
(Amendment) Rules, 2009 was published as required by sub-section (1) of section 15 of the
Industrial Employment (Standing Orders) Act, 1946 (Central Act XX of 1946), in Notification No: LD
282 LET 2009, dated: 07.12.2009 in Part IV-A of the Karnataka Gazette Extraordinary dated:
07.12.2009, inviting objections and suggestions from all the persons likely to be affected thereby
within thirty days from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

And whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 07.12.2009.

And whereas the objections and suggestions received in this regard have been considered by
the State Government.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 15 of the
Industrial Employment (Standing Orders) Act, 1946 (Central Act XX of 1946), the Government of
Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:-

RULES

1. Title and commencement :- (i) These rules may be called the Karnataka Indusirial
Employment (Standing Orders) (Amendment) Rules, 2017.

(ii) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment of Schedule-I :- In the Karnataka Industrial Employment(Standing Orders)
Rules, 1961, in Schedule-I:

() under the heading “Model Standing Orders prescribed under Rule 3(1) : A- For workmen
excluding clerks and other ministerial staff”, in the entries at SLNo.15-A, for the words and figures
“58 years” the words and figures “60 years” shall be substituted.

(ii) under the heading “Model Standing Orders prescribed under Rule 3(1) : B- For Clerks and
other Ministerial Staff”, in the entries at S1.No. 22-A, for the words and figures “58 years” the words
and figures “60 years” shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka

L. S. Srikanta Babu
Deputy Secretary to Government,
Department of Labour,

Bzecd ddgweecd, 55T By Fus, dordach. (87) Fsod: 200

-

Scanned by CamScanner



